
 

AGENDA 

ALTAVISTA TOWN COUNCIL 

WORKSESSION 

Tuesday, August 28, 2018 – 5:00 p.m. 

 

NOTE:  This meeting will begin at the Booker Building (400 Broad Street) 

1. Call to Order 

2. Agenda Amendments/Approval 

3. Booker Building “Visioning Session”  (Attachment #1) 
 

The rest of the meeting will be conducted in Council’s Chambers of Town Hall )510 7th Street. 

4. Public Comments – Agenda Items Only 

5. Introductions and Special Presentations 

6. Items for Discussion 

a. Melinda Pressure Zone Project discussion  (Attachment 2)   

b. Utility Project Proposals – Staff Recommendations  (Attachment 3)  

c. Special Event Policy Discussion  (Attachment 4) 

d. Zoning Ordinance Text Amendments (Attachment 5) 

e. AOT Request for Use of English Park for Giblet Jog (Attachment 6) 

f. English Park Improvements Procurement (Attachment 7) 

g. Delinquent Tax Listing  (Attachment 8) 

 

7. Council Items 

8. Public Comment – Non Agenda Items 

9. Adjournment 
 

Next Scheduled Regular Town Council Meeting:  Tuesday, September 11, 2018 @ 7:00 p.m. 

Notice to comply with Americans with Disabilities Act:  Special assistance is available for disabled persons addressing Town Council. Efforts 

will be made to provide adaptations or accommodations based on individual needs of qualified individuals with disability, provided that 

reasonable advance notification has been received by the Town Clerk’s Office.  For assistance, please contact the Town Clerk’s Office, 

Town of Altavista, 510 Seventh Street, Altavista, VA  24517 or by calling (434) 369-5001. 

Thank you for taking the time to participate in your Town Council meeting.  The Mayor and Members of Council invite and encourage you 

to attend whenever possible because good government depends on the interest and involvement of citizens. 



 

Town Council Work Session – Item #: 3 

August 28, 2018 

Booker Building – “Visioning Session”  

 

Agenda Memorandum 

Submitted by: Waverly Coggsdale, Town Manager 

 

Discussion: Town Council will have an opportunity to tour and discuss their visions for future 

improvements and uses for the Booker Building. 

 

 Currently, the building is used for both community and private events, staff has attached a 

list for the past several years of the building use and the revenue generated from the private 

events. 

 

 Following this session, Council can discuss and provide direction to staff. 

 

 

 

 

ATTACHMENTS:  

 Use/Rental Report 

 Booker Building Report (separate cover) 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 



 

BOOKER BUILDING USE/RENTAL INFO

 Rentals Charges

No Charge 

Use

Total 

Uses

FY2018 27 4,450$    5 32

FY2017 24 4,025$    8 32

FY2016 18 2,450$    6 24

FY2015 22 3,075$    8 30

FY2014 22 3,600$    9 31

5 Year Total: 113 17,600$ 36 149



 

Town Council Work Session – Item #: 6a. 

August 28, 2018 

Melinda Area Pressure Zone Project Update 

 

Agenda Memorandum 

Submitted by: Waverly Coggsdale, Town Manager 

 

Discussion: As part of the FY2019 Budget and CIP Town Council included the Preliminary 

Engineering Design for the Melinda Area Pressure Zone Project.   The issue of utilizing 

the capacity of the Melinda Drive Water Tank and increasing the water pressure to the 

residences at or near the same tank elevation has been discussed for several years. 

 

Staff has invited Woodard & Curran representatives to provide an overview of this project 

and the next steps.   Woodard & Curran conducted the Town’s Facility Assessment and 

Improvement Plan (FAIP). Later in the meeting, staff will seek approval of their proposal 

related to this project.  This will be an opportunity for Council to comment and give any 

direction that will be needed. 

 

  

 

ATTACHMENTS:  

 Excerpts from the Town’s Water Facilities Assessment Improvement Plan (FAIP) 

 Drawings of Project Area and Pressures (provided by consultant) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 



4.1.2.2 Melinda Drive Tank 
 
The Melinda Drive Tank is a 1.5-million-gallon steel ground storage tank located in the main 
high-service zone of the system (880.0). This tank was constructed in 1961 and receives water 
from the Bedford Avenue Booster Pump Station. It has an overflow elevation of 880 feet. The 
exterior of the tank was recently repainted. 

 
 

 
 

The interior of the tank is presently scheduled to be painted; however, distribution system 
modifications would have to be implemented before this tank could be removed from service 
since this is the only storage available in this pressure zone. The proposed modifications are 
described in greater detail in Section 4.4.5. 
 
In addition, the Melinda tank is a ground level tank located in a residential neighborhood. As 
such, it has limited ability to supply adequate domestic pressures to neighboring homes. 
Several alternatives have been developed for adding a local booster station to improve pressure 
in the immediate neighborhood over a wider range of Melinda tank water levels. This project has 
not yet been implemented and additional booster stations would be necessary in the Beverly 
Heights and Holly Hills neighborhoods to fully utilize a wider operating range at Melinda Tank. 
Thus, the Melinda tank can only be operated over a very narrow band, to approximately two feet 
from the full-tank level. This is problematic from a zone supply perspective (the long distance 
and narrow pressure band at the Bedford Avenue Booster Pump Station), from a water quality 
perspective, as the Melinda tank water is prone to stratification and stagnation, and from a loss 
of effective storage perspective. The actual effective storage in the top two feet of this 1.5-
million-gallon tank is approximately 67,000 gallons. 
 

 
 
 



4.3 Storage Capacity Evaluation 
 
Distribution storage is provided to meet peak consumer demands, such as peak hour demands, 
and to provide a reserve for firefighting. Storage also serves to provide an emergency supply in 
case of temporary breakdown of pumping facilities and for pressure regulation during periods of 
fluctuating demand. 
 
There are three components that must be considered for evaluating storage requirements. 
These components include equalization, fire flow requirements, and emergency storage. 
Equalization storage provides water from the tanks during peak hourly demands in the system.  
 
Typically, this quantity is a percentage of the maximum daily demands. The percentages can 
range from fifteen to twenty-five percent, depending on the size of the system. Altavista would 
be considered a mid-sized system, meaning twenty percent of the maximum day demand in the 
zone should be available as equalization storage. 
 
The fire flow storage component is based on the fire flow requirement multiplied by the required 
duration of the flow. For the Altavista system, a base fire flow of 3,500 gpm for three hours was 
used for storage evaluation. Based on this, 630,000 gallons of fire flow storage should be 
provided in each zone. 
 
The emergency storage is typically equivalent to an average day demand. However, if there is 
emergency power available at the sources capable of supplying at least an average day 
demand, the emergency storage component can be waived. The WTP is equipped with 
emergency power, but the Staunton River Intake is not. The spring sites and the Bedford Pump 
Station are also not equipped with emergency power. Installing emergency power at the 
Staunton River Intake, Bedford Pump Station, and the spring sites would eliminate or greatly 
reduce the need for this amount of emergency storage. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Table 4-1: Required Storage (Current Demand Conditions) 
 
Zone Equalization 

Storage/Active 
Volume (MG) 

Fire 
Storage 
(MG) 

Emergency 
Storage (MG) 

Required 
Total 
Storage 
(MG) 

Pressure Zone 1 (WTP) 0.68 0.63 2.39 3.70 

Pressure Zone 2 (Melinda) 0.05 0.63 0.23 .91 

Pressure Zone 3 (Dearing Ford) 0.01 0.63 .060 .70 

 

Table 4-2: Available Storage 
 

Source Equalization 
Storage/Active 
Volume (MG)1 
 

Fire Storage (MG)2 Emergency 
Storage 
(MG)3 

Total Storage 
Volume 
Capacity 
(MG) 

Pressure Zone 1 

Clarion Tank Operating Range = 
39-57 ft 

0.00 
Max Elevation in 
Zone = 688 ft4 

0.55 0.8 
Maximum Level = 

742 ft 

Bedford Tank 0.18 
Operating Range 

= 18-24 ft 

0.06 
Max Elevation in 
Zone = 688 ft4 

0.46 0.7 
Maximum Level = 

742.5 ft 

 
 

Pressure Zone 2 

Melinda Tank 0.07 
Operating Range 

= 44-46 ft 

0.46 
Max Elevation in 

Zone = 818 ft 

0.97 1.5 
Maximum Level = 

880 ft 

Pressure Zone 3 

Dearing Ford 0.06 
Operating Range 

= 20-25 ft 

0.24 
Max Elevation in 

Zone = 766 ft 

0.00 
 

0.3 
Maximum Level = 

894 ft 

 
1. Volume between typical operating ranges. 
2. Volume between Equalization Storage and above the level required to maintain a 20-psi 
residual. 
3. Volume below Equalization Storage and Fire Storage volumes. 
4. Assumes 1104 Bedford Avenue is the last customer prior to Bedford Tank on Pressure Zone  
 

Pressure Zone 1 is deficient in all required storage categories. An additional 2.2 million 
gallons of total storage are necessary to meet current conditions. An increase in 
demand, whether caused by population increase or industrial expansion, would 
necessitate additional storage in Pressure Zone 1. The installation of emergency power 
at the Staunton River intake would lessen the need for additional storage in this zone 
but constructing a tank would still provide redundancy and operational benefits. 
 
While the Melinda Tank does have adequate equalization storage, there is no additional 
capacity for future demand increases. There is a 0.17 MG fire flow deficit in the Melinda 



Tank pressure zone. Emergency storage in Pressure Zone 2 is adequate under all 
evaluated demand scenarios.  
 
The Dearing Ford Tank provides adequate equalization storage under current and 
future demand conditions. There is a 0.39 MG deficiency in available fire flow and a 
0.06 MG deficiency in emergency storage. 
 
Recommendations to address the existing and projected storage deficit are presented in 
Section 7 of this report. 
 
4.4 Distribution System Evaluation and Hydraulic Model Analysis 
 
A water distribution system must be capable of meeting two criteria to provide adequate service. 
In general, a minimum pressure of 35 pounds per square inch (psi) at ground level is required 
during average day, maximum day, and peak hour demand conditions. During maximum day 
demand conditions with a fire flow, a minimum pressure of 20 psi is required at ground level 
throughout the system. 
 
In addition, per the American Water Works Association (AWWA) “Manual of Water Supply 
Practices: Computer Modeling of Water Distribution Systems,” a system has deficient pipe 
looping and sizing if the following conditions occur: 
 

 Velocities greater than 5 feet per sec (fps) 
 

 Headlosses greater than 6 feet per 1,000 feet 
 

 Large diameter pipes (16-inch diameter or greater) having headlosses greater than 1 feet 
per 1,000 feet 
 

  
As the velocity in a pipe increases, the risk of potential problems, such as water hammer, 
increases. Excessive headloss in a pipe results in wasted energy in the system due to 
increased pumping. 
 
To evaluate the system’s ability to meet these criteria, hydraulic simulations were run in the 
model. Recommendations to improve deficiencies under current or future demand conditions 
are discussed in Section 7. 
 
 

 
4.4.1 Pressure 
 
A minimum pressure of 35 psi is recommended throughout the distribution system. An upper 
limiting pressure of 120 psi is generally recommended, as older fittings in the system are 
generally rated at 125 to 150 psi. Pressures above this level can result in increased water use 
from fixtures and increased leakage throughout the distribution system. 
 
Under existing demand conditions, there are a few areas of the system that see pressures 
below 35 psi. The high portions of Avondale Drive and Melinda Drive see pressures ranging 



from 23 to 28 psi under normal operating conditions. 10th and 11th Street, on the low-pressure 
zone near the Bedford Tank, see pressures between 26 and 35 psi during normal operating 
conditions. Under 2037 demand conditions, the higher elevation area of Beverly Heights and 
Laurel Lane have pressures ranging from 34 to 55 psi.  
 
The only area that sees pressures above 120 psi is Clarion Road, particularly near the 
intersection with Lynch Mill Road. This section of the road sees pressures as high as 145 psi 
during current and future demand conditions. 
 

4.4.2 Fire Flow 
 
Per the AWWA, the minimum recommended fire flow in residential areas with one- and two-
family dwellings not exceeding two stories in height is based on the distance between buildings. 
The recommended fire flow in areas with homes more than 100 feet apart is approximately 500 
gpm, between 31 feet and 100 feet apart is approximately 750 gpm, between 11 feet and 30 
feet is approximately 1,000 gpm, and less than 10 feet is approximately 1,500 gpm. 
 
Recommended fire flows for other buildings, such as condominiums, apartment complexes, 
schools, and commercial or industrial buildings are typically calculated by the Insurance 
Services Office (ISO) and are based on building structure, floor area, the building’s use and 
contents, and the availability of fire suppression systems. Although ISO evaluated and classified 
the Altavista system in 2015, data for specific buildings was not available. The typical maximum 
fire flow is 3,500 gpm. For this report, we identified areas with less than 1,000 gpm as being 
deficient in fire flow. 
 
There are three main areas within the Altavista system that have fire flows below 1,000 gpm. 
River Road has an available fire flow of approximately 350 gpm. Adding a connection to Tabby 
Lane in the Beverly Heights neighborhood would increase the available fire flow in this 
neighborhood. North Gate Road and associated side streets see available fire flows ranging 
from 600 to 800 gpm. Lastly, the neighborhood served by Beverly Heights and Laurel Lane sees 
available fire flows between 800 and 900 gpm. These areas are in the Melinda Tank pressure 
zone, which as noted in Section 4.3, is slightly deficient in available fire flow. 
 
 
 

4.4.5 System Conditions with Melinda Tank Offline 
 
The Melinda Tank is scheduled to be painted; therefore, the Town needs the flexibility to take 
the tank offline. Currently, the only supply to the zone is via the Bedford Pump Station. We 
modeled the system after the inclusion of a new flow control valve to allow for the connection of 
the Dearing Ford Tank zone and the Melinda Tank zone. A schematic showing the proposed 
valve locations is found in Figure 36. 
 
Based on our model outputs, we propose utilizing the Bedford pumps on variable frequency 
drives to supply domestic pressure to the Melinda Tank zone without excessive cycling or 
significant pressure increases at the low points in the zone. Fire flow would be provided by both 
Bedford pumps and the flow control valve from the Dearing Ford Tank zone. The available fire 
flow with the Melinda Tank offline ranges from 800-900 gpm and is limited by the normal low 
pressures near Melinda Tank, which allows for only a small amount of headloss during a low fire 
flow event before pressures drop below 20 psi. 



 
While the Melinda Tank is offline, the use of the Campbell County Utilities and Service Authority 
interconnection near the Dearing Ford Tank would be necessary to provide fire flows and 
maintain pressures in the event of a water main break. A Standard Operating Procedure should 
be developed describing valve operation during this condition. 
 
The installation of the flow control valve allows the Dearing Ford Tank to serve the Melinda 
Tank zone if pressures in that zone drop close to 20 psi, while preventing the draining of the 
Dearing Ford Tank or the Clarion Tank. 
 

7.1 Short-Term Improvements (0 – 7 years) 
 
The following projects are categorized as short-term priorities. 
 

7.1.1 Melinda and Avondale Drive Pump Station and Pipe Network 
 
As noted in Section 4, there are three parts of the Melinda Tank zone that suffer from low 
pressures and fire flows. Installing booster stations at these three locations would allow for an 
increase in the operating range of the Melinda Tank. 
 
The first of these three areas are near the Melinda Tank, on Melinda Drive and Avondale Drive. 
Due to the location of this low-pressure area, water mains used to serve domestic residential 
needs at a boosted pressure would be installed, running parallel to the existing mains. This 
design has been largely completed. The anticipated cost of the booster station and pipe network 
is approximately $712,000. 
 

7.1.2 Beverly Heights Pump Station 
 
Another area within the Melinda Tank zone that suffers from low pressure and fire flows is the 
Beverly Heights neighborhood. This booster station would be installed in line with the existing 
water main. The anticipated cost of this booster station is approximately $240,000. 
 

7.1.3 Holly Hills Drive and Northgate Road Pump Station 
The third area within the Melinda Tank zone that suffers from low pressure and fire flows is the 
Holly Hills Drive and Northgate Road neighborhood. This booster station would be installed in 
line with the existing water main. The anticipated cost of this booster station is approximately 
$240,000. 
 



MELINDA PRESSURE ZONE MAPS 
 

 

  



Current Average Day Demand Conditions 

 

  



Future Average Day Demand Conditions 

 
 
 



 

Town Council Work Session – Item #: 6b 

August 28, 2018 

Engineering Proposal Quotes - FY2019 CIP Items 

Agenda Memorandum 

Submitted by: Thomas W. Fore Utilities Director 

 

Discussion:  The 2019 CIP items that require engineering design for upcoming projects that were listed 

in the Facility Assessment and Improvement Plan (FAIP) were provided to the Town’s 

approved list of Engineers for proposal quotes on the upcoming projects. 

 

 

2019 CIP ENGINEERING PROJECTS 

PROJECT CIP Budget Hurt & 

Proffitt 

Peed & Bortz Woodard & Curran 

Standard Specifications and Details $30,000.00 $50,200.00 $6,000.00 No Quote 

Flow Control Valve 

(Dearing Ford to Melinda Tank) 
$70,000.00 No Bid $7,400.00 

For Design of valve 

and SCADA 

$45,400.00 
For Design and SCADA 

Design & construction of 

SCADA Improvements to 

new valve & Clarion Tank 

Site. 

Melinda and Avondale Drive Pump 

Station and Pipe Network 
$76,000.00 No Bid $67,300.00 to 

$77,300.00 

Quote is on all Projects 

combined. 

Beverly Heights Pump Station $28,000.00 No Bid $14,300.00  

Northgate Holly Hills Pump Station $28,000.00 No Bid $100,300.00 $108,000.00 

Total for Melinda Zone $132,000.00    

WWTP Electrical Upgrade Phase 1 $110,000.00 No Bid $42,100 $105,000.00 

 

The Engineering firms were provided information from the Facility Assessment and 

Improvement Plan (FAIP). In order to provide the above listed quotes to the Town for our 

consideration.  

 

Recommendation: 

 

In reviewing all quote information from the engineering firms and to ensure that the Town 

has the best deliverables at the end of the project designs my recommendation is to award 

the projects as follows: 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

ATTACHMENTS: 

 None 

 

 

 

 

PROJECT CIP Budget Firm Awarded Quote 

Standard Specifications and Details $30,000.00 Peed & Bortz $6,000.00 

Flow Control Valve 

(Dearing Ford to Melinda Tank) 
 

$70,000.00 

 

Woodard & Curran 

 

$45,400.00 

 

Melinda and Avondale Drive, 

Beverly Heights, Holly Hills Pump 

Stations and Pipe Network (All 

three projects 

 

$132,000.00 

 

Woodard & Curran 

 

$108,000.00 

WWTP Electrical Upgrade Phase 1 $110,000.00 Peed & Bortz $42,100.00 



 

Town Council Work Session – Item #: 6c. 

August 28, 2018 

Special Event Policy Discussion 

 

Agenda Memorandum 

Submitted by: Waverly Coggsdale, Town Manager 

 

Discussion: Staff presented Town Council with a draft Special Events Policy at their June Work 

Session, this included a Special Event Application as well.  At that time, Town Council 

took the item under advisement and would review the document.  Council requested that 

staff seek information in regard to cost of insurance for events, this information was 

provided to Town Council at their July 24, 2018 Work Session. 

 

 At this time, this item has been placed on the August Work Session agenda at Council’s 

request.  Staff seeks any direction that Council may wish to provide on this item. 

 

 

ATTACHMENTS:  

 Special Events Policy (Draft) 

 Special Event Application (Draft) 

 Special Event Insurance Information 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 



 

 

TOWN OF ALTAVISTA  

Office of the Town Manager  

510 7th Street/P.O. Box 420, Altavista, VA 24517 

Telephone: (434) 369-5001 

Fax: (434) 369-4369 

 

SPECIAL EVENTS USE POLICY 

June 2018 

 

1. Purpose 

The Town of Altavista welcomes and encourages special events that enhance the life of the 

community.  The purpose of this Special Event Use Policy is to promote enjoyment of public 

property through such events, while also establishing standards for protecting it and respecting the 

reasonable expectations of our town neighbors.  This policy also clarifies the responsibilities and 

liabilities for those conducting private activities on public property. 

 

2. Definition 

For the purpose of this policy, the following Definitions shall apply unless the context clearly 

indicates or requires a different meaning: 

 

Public Area.  Primarily an area dedicated, reserved or set aside for public use and maintained by 

or under the control of the Town of Altavista.  Among other places, it includes streets, alleys, 

sidewalks, parking lots, parks and other open space and property owned by the Town of Altavista.  

(NOTE:  This policy does not include the Altavista Train Station, which is regulated and rented by 

the Altavista Area Chamber of Commerce.)  Further, streets under the control of the Virginia 

Department of Transportation (VDOT) and the sidewalks along those streets are a Public Area for 

the purpose herein when appropriate consent has been obtained from VDOT> 

 

 

Special Event.  An outdoor temporary activity or promotion, commercial or non-commercial, at a 

specific location that is open to the public and is planned or reasonably expected to attract/assemble 

fifty or more persons, require street closures and/or sidewalks, or which may restrict or interfere 

with the right of merchants, the public and private individuals to have access to offices, stores, 

residences or other places.  Special events include, but are not limited to, parades, carnivals, 

festivals, circuses, music fairs or concerts, tent revivals, art shows, craft shows, rodeos, corn mazes, 

historic reenactments, equestrian shows, firework displays and events, or similar events open to the 

public.  A private party held at a Banquet/Event Facility (including Hotel, Conference Center, 

Restaurant, Bed and Breakfast, Country Inn, Rural Retreat or Rural Resort or similar facility) shall 

not be deemed a special event. 

 



 
3. Special Events Policy 

The Town of Altavista hereby establishes the following policy to govern special events.  This policy 

shall apply to applications for use of public roads closed upon request and all town parks and 

grounds. 

 

Any individual or organization planning an event must complete a “Special Event Application 

Form” available online.  The Town of Altavista will consider each application including, as needed, 

input from Department of Planning & Community  Development, Altavista Police Department, 

Public Works and any other town, county, or state agency that may be involved in the event.  To 

allow for the review period the applications are requested 90 (ninety) days in advance of the event 

date. 

  



 
 

 

 

PERMIT EXCEPTIONS 

 

The following events are subject to exemption from the Special Events Policy. 

 

1) Funerals 

2) Educational activities involving students and/or faculty provided the event is under 

the immediate direction and supervision of school administrative personnel. 

3) The Town of Altavista or any other governmental unit carrying out its normal 

functions. 

4) Special Events sponsored or substantially administered by the Town of Altavista or 

an authorized agent of the Town provided the Special Event is insured against 

accidents and liabilities by the Town or by the entity acting on behalf of the Town. 

5) In general, Neighborhood Parties held in a neighborhood cul-de-sac or on a road 

with only one entrance where all the affected residents have been notified.  However, 

block parties and other social events scheduled in residential neighborhoods may 

require minimal regulation when streets are closed to vehicular traffic. 

6) Spontaneous events lasting no more than two (2) hours occasioned by news or public 

affairs coming into the public knowledge at large without the payment of admission 

fees or other charges and do not involve substantial commercial activity. 

 

Note:  There may be other requirements (i.e. Noise Permit, etc.) that are not exempt. 

 

 

PERMIT REQUIRED 

 

It shall be unlawful for any person to conduct, sponsor, maintain or assist in maintaining a 

Special Event, as defined above, within or on any public area without first obtaining the permit 

required herein and maintaining the validity of the permit throughout the Special Event. 

 

APPLICATION PROCESS/REQUIREMENTS 

 

A completed application and special event application map showing potential road closures, 

on-site sanitary facilities based on crowd size and event duration must be submitted to the 

Department of Planning & Community Development with payment of the $25 zoning 

application fee with the application.  The Department of Planning & Community Development 

is located in Town Hall at 510 7th Street.  Upon receipt of the completed application, the 

Department of Planning & Community Development will route the application to the Town of 

Altavista Police Department for logistics review, other departmental routing as needed and 

recommendation to the Town Manager.  

 

Section I. Permit 



 
Applicant/Personal. If the applicant is representing an organization or group, that information 

is included; however, the permit will be issued in the name of the specific individual and that 

individual shall be personally responsible for the information provided and for compliance with 

the terms and conditions of the permit.  The person designated by the application as the person 

for the Special Event shall be physically present and accept responsibility for compliance with 

any and all terms as set forth in this policy. 

 

Transferability. The permit granted under this policy shall not be transferable or assignable. 

 

Benefit. No permit shall be issued for an event which is substantially intended to financially 

benefit the applicant or sponsor of the event unless the individual or sponsor can demonstrate 

the public purposes to be achieved. 

 

Additional Rental Requirements. Events requesting the use of Town Parks or the Booker 

Building must obtain a separate rental permit from Town Hall, for additional information call 

(434) 369-5001.  Fees will be based on use type and duration. 

 

 

 

The permit issued for a Special Event under this policy shall be subject to the regulations, conditions 

and reservations of rights as set forth in this section. 

 

1. Regulations 

 

a. Any other permit required for the Special Event shall be obtained, including permits 

for the service and consumption of alcoholic beverages, permits issued by VDOT, 

Campbell County Health Department, Town of Altavista Planning and Zoning 

Department and other similar licenses or permit.  At least 30 (thirty) days prior to 

holding a special event, to the extent such is required, provide to the Town written 

proof of approval, including copies of any permits or licenses if required. 

 

b. Provide adequate security subject to coordination with police, including emergency, 

sanitation, traffic control and refreshment services at each special event or activity at 

their cost. 

 

c. Provide portable toilets as needed. 

 

d. Restore the site to its original condition, removing all trash equipment, etc., 

immediately following the event, regardless of the source.  The permitted group 

shall compensate the Town of Altavista for any extraordinary clean-up or repairs 

required as a result of the approved activity. 

 

e. Comply with state law and all requirements of the Town Code and all additional 

requirements that either the Town Council or the Town Staff impose upon the event. 

Section II. Regulations & Conditions 



 
 

2. Conditions 

a. Indemnity.  In consideration of the granting of the permit under this policy, the 

applicant and any entity represented by such person shall indemnify and hold 

harmless the Town of Altavista, its officers, agents and employees against all loss, 

expense or liability of any kind, including attorney’s fees, caused by or in any way 

resulting from the acts of any person attending the Special Event or in any way 

resulting from the activities carried on during he  

 

 

b. Insurance.  The applicant and sponsor of the Special Event shall secure and at all 

times maintain in full force and effect a comprehensive general liability insurance 

policy providing bodily injury and property damage liability protection in the 

amount of $1,000,000.  The Town of Altavista, its officers, agents and employees are 

included as additional insured with respect to the general liability insurance policy.  

This insurance shall be issued by a company licensed to do business in the 

Commonwealth of Virginia and shall be endorsed to the effect that the policy shall 

not be terminated or cancelled prior to its expiration date except upon thirty (30) 

days advance written notice to the Town.  The insurance shall cover the Special Event 

and the types of activities carried on at the Special Event.  The applicant and sponsor 

shall provide proof of the required insurance coverage in the form of an original 

current certificate of insurance presented by the insured’s agency.  Evidence of such 

insurance shall be provided to the Town at least five (5) days before the date of the 

Special Event.  The special event permit shall be null and void without an insurance, 

as required herein. 

 

c. Strict Liability. The applicant and sponsor of the Special Event shall assume and be 

strictly liable, without regard to negligence, for all damage or injury caused to public 

property as well as the buildings, residences and structures adjacent to the public 

area during and throughout the period of time that the public area remains closed 

for public use. 

 

3. Reservation of Right.  The Town of Altavista reserves the right to suspend all or any part of 

a Special Event and to require all persons to immediately vacate the Public Area during any 

period of national or local emergency, natural disaster, and lawlessness and other acts or 

events which threaten public safety. 

 

4. Town Council Approval 

Some special event applications that involve closure of public roads or use of town parks and 

grounds which cannot be approved administratively require Town Council approval.  You will 

be notified when your special event application is on the Town Council agenda as your presence 

is expected.  The Council is aware of the problems that street closures may cause to businesses, 

residents and drivers.  The time and day of the event will be key factors in considering whether 

to allow an event requiring street closures. 

 

Applications which may be administratively approved by the Town Manager include:   



 
a. Special Events which have been approved in consecutive years prior to the current 

request and which have no proposed changes to layout, logistics and schedule times.   

b. Events which do not require street closures or reservation of public parking spaces.  

c. Events which do not require a substantial interference with the general public’s use 

of a Public Area. 

 

 

 

5. Revocation or Denial of Permit 

The application for any permit may be denied and any permit issued under this policy may be 

revoked if: 

 

a) The application contains false or misleading information or does not set forth all of the 

information requested, or 

b) The Special Event is operated in such a manner as to create a public nuisance or to constitute 

a hazard to the public health, safety and welfare, or 

c) The applicant and/or sponsor of the event has failed to obtain and maintain any health, 

business or other license or permit required by law for the activities carried on during the 

Special Event, or 

d) The applicant and/or sponsor of the Special  Event has violated or is attempting to violate 

any of the terms and conditions of this policy, or 

e) If there is a conflict with any previously scheduled Special Event.  Events sponsored by the 

Town or carried out on behalf of the Town as part of its public service shall be given priority 

in scheduling.  Otherwise, scheduling shall be on a first come first served basis. 

 

 

 

The Town Manager or his/her designee, shall have the right to grant waivers concerning 

scheduling or other minor requirements of this Policy where there is a hardship caused to the 

applicant by the strict enforcement of this Policy provided the health, safety and welfare of the 

public is not placed at risk and the overall intent of this Policy can be achieved. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

   

Section III. Revocation or Denial of Permit 

Section IV. Waivers 



ROUTING (initial/date)  
Fee Paid________________ 
P&CD_________/_________ 
Police_________/_________ 
Town Mgr.______ /________ 
 

 
 

APPLICATION FOR SPECIAL EVENT/PARADE PERMIT 

 

Activity___________________________________________   Date of Application___________________________ 

Sponsored By______________________________________ Location of Event_____________________________ 

For Profit_______  Non Profit____________  Tax Exempt No._____________________ 

 

Name__________________________________________ Home #___________________ Work #______________ 

Address________________________________________ City/State__________________ Zip_________________ 

Email_____________________________________________________________________ 

 

Description of Event: 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Date of Event_____________________________  Rain Date_______________________________ 

Event Hours______________________________   

Set Up Time______________________________  Clean Up Time___________________________ 

Anticipated Attendance (per day): Participants________________   Spectators_______________________ 



   
 

Will you need electricity?   Yes      No  (if yes, service type and number of outlets____________ 

Will food be served?    Yes       No 

Will fees for food or     Yes   No 
merchandise be charged? 
  
Will admission fees, entry fees    Yes   No 
or other fees be charged as  
part, or in association with 
the activity? 
 

Will portable restrooms be provided?   Yes     No  (if yes, how many) _______________________ 

Will there be parking control staff?    Yes     No  (if yes, how many) _______________________ 

Will you have security on site?     Yes     No  (if yes, who) ____________________________ 

Will any items be left overnight?    Yes     No  (if yes, where) __________________________ 

Will signs or banners be displayed?   Yes     No  (if yes, where) __________________________ 

Will tents be erected?     Yes     No  (if yes, what size) ________________________ 

Will water hookup be needed?    Yes     No  (if yes, what for?) ________________________ 

Will there be a parade?     Yes     No  (if yes, complete page 3) __________________ 

Will any Town streets need to     Yes      No  (if yes, identify) __________________________ 
be closed?   
 

Name of insurance company providing Certificates of Insurance for the event_____________________________ 

 

I agree to indemnify and hold harmless the Town of Altavista, its employees, and its agents from and against any 

and all liability for any injury which may be suffered in connection with this event.  I also hold harmless the Town 

of Altavista, its employees, and its agents from and against any liability for any equipment or supplies lost or 

damaged that are stored or otherwise as a result of this event. 

 

_______________________________________________  _______________________________ 

                                        Signature        Date  

 

 

 

 

 



   

 

Projected number of entries _____________________________ 

Anticipated number of participants _____________________________ 

Will children be involved     Yes   No  (if yes, how many) ___________________________ 

Will animals be involved      Yes   No  (if yes, how many and what type ________________ 

        _____________________________________ 

 

What special conditions will be required, if any, to accommodate animal participants?  ___________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Will motor vehicles be involved? (if yes, how many and what type) ___________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

What additional streets or parking lots will be need, if any? _________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Please review map for parade route. 

 

POLICE REVIEW: ____________________________________________________________________________ 

__________________________________________________________________________________________ 

PUBLIC WORKS REVIEW: ______________________________________________________________________ 

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

MANAGER’S REVIEW: _________________________________________________________________________ 

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

PLANNING/ZONING REVIEW: ___________________________________________________________________ 

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

TO BE COMPLETED FOR PARADE REQUEST 





 

Town Council Work Session – Item #: 6d. 

August 28, 2018 

Zoning Ordinance Text Amendments  

 

Agenda Memorandum 

Submitted by: Waverly Coggsdale, Town Manager 

 

Discussion: Staff presented the Planning Commission’s recommendations on two proposed Zoning 

Ordinance Text Amendments at Town Council’s August Regular Meeting.  The two text 

ordinance amendments deal with: 1) Mobile Restaurants (Food Trucks); and 2) Keeping of 

Horses in Town. 

 

 At this time, this item has been placed on the August Work Session agenda at Council’s 

request.  Staff seeks any direction that Council may wish to provide on this item. 

 

 Council may decide to move forward with one or both of the text amendments.  If so then, 

we would conduct a “First Reading” and then schedule a Public Hearing on the item(s). 

 

 

ATTACHMENTS:  

 Planning Commission Recommendation 

 Zoning Ordinance Text Amendment 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 



































 

Town Council Work Session – Item: #6e 

August 28, 2018 

AOT’s Request to Use English Park for Giblet Jog 5k Race 

Agenda Memorandum 

Submitted by: Emelyn Gwynn, Main Street Coordinator 

 

Discussion:    Altavista On Track would like to request permission from Town Council to use 

English Park on Thanksgiving Day, November 22, 2018 for the 12th Annual Giblet 

Jog 5K Run from 6:30 a.m. - 11:30 a.m. AOT and race day volunteers will start out 

in the Booker Building by registering last minute runners and handing out race day 

packets to runners. The race will start at 8:30 a.m. near the playground/pavilion. 

Runners will run the loop that circles the playing fields, and then follow the trail 

that goes under the bridge. Once runners reach the end of the end of the trail, they 

will circle back and cross the finish line where they started, near the 

playground/pavilion. Each year, AOT works with the Town, Public Works and the 

Police Department to insure that the gates are unlocked at English Park and that the 

electricity is working near the pavilion and Booker Building.  AOT also notifies 

Campbell County EMS about the race and an EMS is usually present at the race if 

available.  

 

Requested Action: Consensus of Town Council to place approval of this item on the September 11th 

Consent Agenda. 

 

 

ATTACHMENTS: 

 Map of race route  

 MOU between AOT & Town of Altavista 
 
 

 

 



AOT’s  GIBLET JOG ROUTE MAP 

 



 
 

Memorandum of Understanding 
This Memorandum of Understanding will serve as a contract between the Town of Altavista and 

the party listed below.   

 

Dates of Use:_____English Park on November 22,2018 6:30am until 11:30 am        _ 

 

Facility:  _______English Park & Park Trail in county section____________________ 

 

Responsible Party:  _____Emelyn Gwynn__________________________________ 

 

Organization: ________Altavista On Track___________________________________ 

 

Address: __________510 7th Street Altavista, VA 24517____________        ________ 

 

Phone:: _(434) 369-5001___________________________ 

  

This contract lists the responsibilities of the Town of Altavista and the above-named party or 

parties. 

 

Responsibilities of the Town of Altavista 

Trail around ball fields in the Riverside Section of English Park– begin and end near the 

playground area of the park. 

Use of Pavilion near playground 

Use of Booker Building 

Use of Parking lots on all park  

 

Responsibilities of the Organization & Responsible Party 

Release Town of Altavista and their agents of all responsibilities and liabilities. 

Leave the property clean with all trash removed 

Remove the any tents, tables etc. 

 

 

Responsible Party: __________________________ _______________  Date: ____ _____ 

 

Town of Altavista Representative: __________________________ ___ Date: ____ _____ 

  

 



 

Town Council Work Session – Item #: 6f. 

August 28, 2018 

English Park Improvements - Procurement  

 

Agenda Memorandum 

Submitted by: Waverly Coggsdale, Town Manager 

 

Discussion: Town Council directed staff to proceed with implementation of several projects include in 

the newly adopted “Parks and Trails Master Plan”. 

 

 At this time, staff is working on the procurement for goods and services related to three of 

the projects, all which tie together.  The projects include the construction of a splash pad; 

replacement of the playground; and the construction of a shade structure in English Park.  

These projects are planned to be located in the area where the existing playground is located 

(behind the existing pavilion) and will encompass the open grass area from the basketball 

courts to the service drive to the maintenance building.   

 

 Pursuant to Section 2.-262 (a), “Upon a determination made in advance by the town 

council set forth in writing that competitive sealed bidding is either not practicable or not 

fiscally advantageous to the public, goods, services, or insurance may be procured by 

competitive negotiation.  The writing shall document the basis for this determination.”   

 

 Written Basis for Determination to Utilize Competitive Negotiation 

 

 Based on the vast nature of the components and features that are available for inclusion in 

the splash pad, playground and shade structure projects specifically bidding out this project 

is not practicable and the ability to negotiate for such goods and services should enhance 

the Town’s ability to design a project within the budget. 

 

 Staff is seeking Council’s approval of a determination in regard to use of the Competitive 

Negotiation process rather than the Competitive Sealed Bidding process.  The RFP would 

be issued/advertised within the next two weeks. 

 

 

ATTACHMENTS:  

None 
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