

Tabulation Sheet for
Uniforms, Shop Towels, Tablecloths Mat Rental

Description	Cintas	UniFirst
Slash Pocket Jacket	\$0.356	\$0.820
Team Jacket	\$0.402	\$0.840
Hip Length Jacket	\$0.602	\$0.880
Non-Supervisory Work Shirts - option 1	\$0.194	\$1.760
Non-Supervisory Work Shirts - option 2	\$0.780	\$2.530
Non-Supervisory Work Shirts - option 3	\$0.270	\$3.960
Non-Supervisory Work Pants - option 1	\$0.486	\$2.420
Non-Supervisory Work Pants - option 2	\$0.510	\$3.080
Non-Supervisory Work Pants - option 3	\$0.220	\$4.290
Non-Supervisory Work Pants - option 4	\$0.420	\$2.950
Non-Supervisory Work Pants - option 5	\$0.770	\$3.080
Shorts	\$0.702	\$0.850
Coveralls - option 1	\$1.720	\$0.700
Coveralls - option 2	\$1.950	\$1.320
Supervisory Men's Oxford	\$0.270	\$2.200
Supervisory Women's Oxford	\$0.270	\$2.310
Supervisory Men's Dress Pants	\$0.225	\$2.640
Supervisory Women's Dress Pants	\$0.275	\$3.740
Mats 4' x 6'	\$2.710	\$1.920
Mats 3' x 5'	\$1.600	\$1.200
Mats 3' x 10'	\$3.220	\$2.400
Terry Cloth Shop Towels	\$0.120	\$9.000
Bath Towels	\$0.220	\$7.200
Red Shop Rags	\$0.060	\$5.000
White Round 136" Tablecloths	no bid	no bid
Delivery Schedule	Wednesday am	not listed
Costs for lost or stolen garment		
Supervisory pleated pants	\$23.420	\$21.110
Oxford Shirts	\$22.400	\$17.540
Work Trousers - option 1	\$23.420	\$19.250
Work Trousers - option 2	\$23.420	\$23.320
Work Trousers - option 3	\$23.420	\$50.360
Pre-Washed Denim Dungaree	\$25.000	\$51.000
Cargo Pants	\$27.490	\$24.600
Non-Suprevisory work shirts - option 1	\$15.270	\$13.700
	\$15.270	\$18.820
Non-Suprevisory work shirts - option 3	\$15.270	\$46.540
Slash Pocket Jacket	\$40.750	\$35.120
Team Jacket	\$45.810	\$36.570
Hip Length Jacket	\$31.560	\$37.640
Coveralls - option 1	\$30.540	\$29.930
Coveralls - option 2	\$30.540	\$85.640
Shorts	\$27.490	\$15.050
Set up fee for embroidery on emblem	\$5.000	no bid
Cost to sew on embroidery emblem	\$3.500	no bid
Cost to iron-on embroidery emblem	\$2.250	no bid