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NORTH ROYALTON CITY COUNCIL
AGENDA
MARCH 7, 2023

7:00 p.m. Caucus Council Meeting 7:00 p.m.

REGULAR ORDER OF BUSINESS

1.

2.

10.

11.

12.

Call to Order.
Opening Ceremony (Pledge of Allegiance).
Roll Call.

Approval of Consent Agenda: Items listed under the Consent Agenda are considered routine. Each item
will be read individually into the record and the Consent Agenda will then be enacted as a whole by one
motion and one roll call. There will be no separate discussion of these items. If discussion by Council is
desired on any Consent Agenda item, or if discussion is requested by the public on any legislative item
on the Consent Agenda, that item will be removed from the Consent Agenda and considered in its normal
sequence under the Regular Order of Business.

a. Approval of Minutes: February 21, 2023 and Committee of the Whole minutes of February 21,
2023.
b. Grant of authority to the Mayor to exercise the city's unilateral option to extend the existing

contract with Rumpke for an additional year (2" year extension) under the same terms and
conditions as in the existing agreement (Ordinance No. 17-06).

C. Legislation: Introduce, suspend rules requiring 3 readings and referral to committee, and adopt
those legislative items indicated with an asterisk (*).

Communications.

Mayor's Report.

Department Head Reports.

President of Council's Report.

Committee Reports:

Building & Building Codes John Nickell
Finance Paul Marnecheck
Review & Oversight Jeremy Dietrich
Safety Michael Wos
Storm Water Linda Barath
Streets Joanne Krejci
Utilities

Report from Council Representatives to regulatory or other boards:

Board of Zoning Appeals John Nickell
Planning Commission Paul Marnecheck
Recreation Board Jeremy Dietrich
Public Discussion: Five minute maximum, on current agenda legislation only.
LEGISLATION

FIRST READING CONSIDERATION

*1. 23-25- ARESOLUTION DONATING FOUR (4) FORMER MAYOR PORTRAITS TO THE
NORTH ROYALTON HISTORICAL SOCIETY, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

* 2. 23-26 - ARESOLUTION STRONGLY URGING THE OHIO GOVERNOR AND MEMBERS
OF THE OHIO GENERAL ASSEMBLY TO RESTORE THE LOCAL GOVERNMENT
FUND TO PRE-RECESSION LEVELS, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

3. 23-27 - A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR’S APPOINTMENT OF
ANTHONY KOTAR AS A FIREFIGHTER/PARAMEDIC IN THE CITY OF NORTH
ROYALTON FIRE DEPARTMENT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.



Council Agenda

13.

14.

4.

10.

Page 2 March 7, 2023

23-28 - A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR’S APPOINTMENT OF
ROBERT HARDY, JR. AS A FIREFIGHTER/PARAMEDIC IN THE CITY OF NORTH
ROYALTON FIRE DEPARTMENT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

23-29 - A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR’S APPOINTMENT OF
JOSEPH BENO AS A FIREFIGHTER/PARAMEDIC IN THE CITY OF NORTH
ROYALTON FIRE DEPARTMENT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

23-30 - AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF AMERICAN ROADWAY
LOGISTICS FOR THE 2023 ROAD MAINTENANCE PROGRAM AS THE LOWEST AND
BEST BID, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

23-31 - AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF CROSSROADS ASPHALT
RECYCLING, INC. FOR THE 2023 ROAD MAINTENANCE PROGRAM AS THE
LOWEST AND BEST BID, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

23-32 - AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF INDEPENDENCE CEMENT, LLC
FOR THE 2023 ROAD MAINTENANCE PROGRAM AS THE LOWEST AND BEST BID,
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

23-33 - AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN
AMENDMENT TO THE AGREEMENT WITH TYLER TECHNOLOGIES, INC. AS
AMENDED BY ORDINANCE 22-77 FOR THE FURNISHING, DELIVERY AND
INSTALLATION OF COMPUTER HARDWARE AND SOFTWARE AND OTHER
SERVICES FOR A FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT INFORMATION AND APPLICATIONS
SYSTEM FOR THE FINANCIAL FUNCTIONS OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
FOR AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $55,869.37, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

23-34 - AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN
AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON AND HINCKLEY
TOWNSHIP FOR THE RESURFACING AND REPAIR OF BOSTON ROAD EAST OF
RIDGE ROAD, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

Miscellaneous.

Adjournment.



RESOLUTION NO. 23-25 INTRODUCED BY: Mayor Antoskiewicz

A RESOLUTION DONATING FOUR (4) FORMER MAYOR PORTRAITS
TO THE NORTH ROYALTON HISTORICAL SOCIETY, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The City is in possession of four (4) former North Royalton Mayor portraits; and

WHEREAS: The North Royalton Historical Society would like to acquire and display these at the James
Buckingham Museum for visitors to view and help tell the story of the history of North
Royalton city government; and

WHEREAS:  Council believes it is in the best interest of the City to donate the four (4) former North
Royalton Mayor portraits to the North Royalton Historical Society due to their historic and
educational value; and

WHEREAS: Council desires to provide for this donation.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA, AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. The Council hereby approves the donation of four (4) former North Royalton Mayor portraits to the
North Royalton Historical Society.

Section 2. The North Royalton Historical Society will provide a receipt to the city that will identify date of
receipt of the portraits.

Section 3. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 4. This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to donate the four (4) former North Royalton Mayor portraits to the North Royalton
Historical Society due to their historic nature and need for preservation.

THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor;
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



RESOLUTION NO. 23-26 INTRODUCED BY: Marnecheck, Nickell, Barath, Krejci,
Dietrich, Wos, Mayor Antoskiewicz

A RESOLUTION STRONGLY URGING THE OHIO GOVERNOR AND MEMBERS OF THE OHIO
GENERAL ASSEMBLY TO RESTORE THE LOCAL GOVERNMENT FUND TO PRE-RECESSION
LEVELS, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The Local Government Fund was reduced in 2011 by 50% during Gov. Kasich's
Administration from 3.68% of General Revenue Funds to its current level of 1.66% of General
Revenue Funds; and

WHEREAS: Past Ohio General Assemblies have repeatedly decreased funding and revenue sharing in
recent years in addition to significantly reducing the Local Government Fund, including
eliminating the Estate Tax and phasing out the Tangible Personal Property Tax; and

WHEREAS:  These reductions have resulted in a loss of revenue of $3.3 Million for the City of North
Royalton; and

WHEREAS: This sudden revenue loss has made it increasingly difficult to provide basic services, rebuild
infrastructure, and bolster public safety services; and

WHEREAS:  When municipalities experience success in fostering safe communities, building sound
infrastructure, and increasing economic development, the State of Ohio reaps the benefits as
well; and

WHEREAS: A reinvestment in the Local Government Fund would aid the state in its goal of lowering taxes
on the individual by enabling municipalities to decrease the local tax burden.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA, AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. The Ohio General Assembly should restore the Local Government Fund to pre-recession levels,
ensuring that local communities are able to provide crucial services and improvements in infrastructure and
public safety.

Section 2. This Council does hereby declare its opposition to any further cuts to the Local Government Fund
or the future diversion of revenues from the Local Government Fund.

Section 3. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 4. This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to restore the local government fund to pre-recession levels to ensure that the City of
North Royalton is able to provide crucial services and improvements in infrastructure and public safety.

THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor;
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



RESOLUTION NO. 23-27 INTRODUCED BY: Mayor Antoskiewicz

A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR’S APPOINTMENT OF
ANTHONY KOTAR AS A FIREFIGHTER/PARAMEDIC IN THE CITY OF NORTH
ROYALTON FIRE DEPARTMENT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The Mayor has appointed Anthony Lawrence Kotar as a Firefighter/Paramedic in the City of
North Royalton Fire Department; and

WHEREAS: Council confirms various appointments made by the Mayor; and

WHEREAS: Itis necessary to keep an accurate record of these various appointments as to individuals
appointed and their term of office.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA, AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. Council hereby confirms the appointment of Anthony Lawrence Kotar as a Firefighter/Paramedic
in the City of North Royalton Fire Department, effective February 27, 2023.

Section 2. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 3. This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to keep accurate public records as to the various appointments made by the Mayor and
the date of said appointment.

THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor;
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



RESOLUTION NO. 23-28 INTRODUCED BY: Mayor Antoskiewicz

A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR’S APPOINTMENT OF
ROBERT HARDY, JR. AS A FIREFIGHTER/PARAMEDIC IN THE CITY OF NORTH
ROYALTON FIRE DEPARTMENT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The Mayor has appointed Robert A. Hardy, Jr. as a Firefighter/Paramedic in the City of North
Royalton Fire Department; and

WHEREAS: Council confirms various appointments made by the Mayor; and

WHEREAS: Itis necessary to keep an accurate record of these various appointments as to individuals
appointed and their term of office.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA, AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. Council hereby confirms the appointment of Robert A. Hardy, Jr. as a Firefighter/Paramedic in the
City of North Royalton Fire Department, effective February 27, 2023.

Section 2. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 3. This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to keep accurate public records as to the various appointments made by the Mayor and
the date of said appointment.

THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor;
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



RESOLUTION NO. 23-29 INTRODUCED BY: Mayor Antoskiewicz

A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR’S APPOINTMENT OF
JOSEPH BENO AS A FIREFIGHTER/PARAMEDIC IN THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON
FIRE DEPARTMENT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The Mayor has appointed Joseph Beno as a Firefighter/Paramedic in the City of North
Royalton Fire Department; and

WHEREAS: Council confirms various appointments made by the Mayor; and

WHEREAS: Itis necessary to keep an accurate record of these various appointments as to individuals
appointed and their term of office.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA, AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. Council hereby confirms the appointment of Joseph Beno as a Firefighter/Paramedic in the City of
North Royalton Fire Department, effective February 27, 2023.

Section 2. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 3. This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to keep accurate public records as to the various appointments made by the Mayor and
the date of said appointment.

THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor;
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



ORDINANCE NO. 23-30 INTRODUCED BY: Krejci, Barath, Marnecheck

AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF AMERICAN ROADWAY LOGISTICS FOR THE 2023
ROAD MAINTENANCE PROGRAM AS THE LOWEST AND BEST BID,
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The City of North Royalton has advertised for bids for the 2023 road maintenance program;
and

WHEREAS: It has been determined that the bid of American Roadway Logistics for pavement marking is
the lowest and best bid; and

WHEREAS: Council desires to accept this bid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. The bid of American Roadway Logistics for pavement marking is hereby accepted as the lowest
and best bid as set forth in Exhibit A attached hereto and incorporated as if fully rewritten.

Section 2. The Mayor is hereby authorized to enter into a contract with American Roadway Logistics in a
form approved by the Director of Law.

Section 3. The Service Director is hereby authorized and directed to forward a certified copy of this
Ordinance to American Roadway Logistics and all certified checks and bonds are hereby authorized to be
returned to the unsuccessful bidders.

Section 4. 1t is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 5. This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to provide for pavement marking for the 2023 road maintenance program in the City of
North Royalton.

THEREFORE, provided this Ordinance receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor;
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



City of North Royalton Service Department
2023 Road Maintenance Program
Bidders Tabulation - PAVEMENT MARKING

Bid Opening on Wednesday, February 22, 2023 at 10:00 am
at North Royalton City Hall, 14600 State Rd

American Roadway Logistics

JD Striping & Services, Inc

Description

Subtotal Bid Price for Auxiliary Traffic Markings $28,000.00 $28,594.76
Subtotal Bid Price for Pavement Marking (All Lines) $64,598.10 $70,200.00
Total Bid Price $92,598.10 $98,794.76

(10% Bid Bond)
Bid Bond X X




ORDINANCE NO. 23-31 INTRODUCED BY: Krejci, Barath, Marnecheck

AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF CROSSROADS ASPHALT RECYCLING, INC. FOR
THE 2023 ROAD MAINTENANCE PROGRAM AS THE LOWEST AND BEST BID,
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The City of North Royalton has advertised for bids for the 2023 road maintenance program;
and

WHEREAS: It has been determined that the bid of Crossroads Asphalt Recycling, Inc. for equipment and
general pavement services is the lowest and best bid; and

WHEREAS: Council desires to accept this bid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. The bid of Crossroads Asphalt Recycling, Inc. for equipment and general pavement services is
hereby accepted as the lowest and best bid as set forth in Exhibit A attached hereto and incorporated as if fully
rewritten.

Section 2. The Mayor is hereby authorized to enter into a contract with Crossroads Asphalt Recycling, Inc. in
a form approved by the Director of Law.

Section 3. The Service Director is hereby authorized and directed to forward a certified copy of this
Ordinance to Crossroads Asphalt Recycling, Inc. and all certified checks and bonds are hereby authorized to
be returned to the unsuccessful bidders.

Section 4. 1t is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 5. This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to provide for equipment and general pavement services for the 2023 road maintenance
program in the City of North Royalton.

THEREFORE, provided this Ordinance receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor;
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



City of North Royalton Service Department

2023 Road Maintenance Program

Bidders Tabulation - EQUIPMENT & GENERAL PAVEMENT SERVICES
Bid Opening on Wednesday, February 22, 2023 at 10:00 am

at North Royalton City Hall, 14600 State Rd

Set In Stone Contracting, LLC Crossroads Asphalt Recycling Inc Geauga Highway Co
Description
3/4 Ton or Larger Pickup Truck - Driver included No Bid |Per Hour Availability $85.00 Per Hour 48 hrs |Availability No Bid  Per Hour Availability
Tandem Axle - Driver included for excavation & material handling $92.00 Per Hour 48 hrs  |Availability $95.00 Per Hour 48 hrs |Availability No Bid  Per Hour Availability
Tri-Axle - Driver included for excavation & material handling $105.00| Per Hour 48 hrs  |Availability $105.00 Per Hour 48 hrs |Availability No Bid  Per Hour Availability
Quad-Axle - Driver included for excavation & material handling No Bid  |Per Hour Availability $120.00 Per Hour = 48 hrs  Availability No Bid  Per Hour Availability
Carry-All - Driver included for excavation & material handling No Bid |Per Hour Availability $215.00 Per Hour 48 hrs |Availability No Bid  Per Hour Availability
Tack Coat Distributor — with Operator No Bid |Per Hour Availability $135.00 Per Hour 48 hrs |Availability $180.00 Per Hour Availability
Pneumatic Compactor — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $105.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  Min to Mobilize TruPac Model| NoBid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#1 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $4,000.00 Per Week | 48 hrs | Availability Rosco Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Milling Machine — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $315.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  Min to Mobilize W 60 Model| NoBid PerHour Min to Mobilize Model
(#2 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $12,500.00 Per Week | 48 hrs  Availability Wirtgen  |Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Milling Machine — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $375.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  Min to Mobilize PM 312 Model| NoBid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#2a on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $15,000.00 Per Week | 48 hrs  Availability CAT Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Milling Machine Full Depth Planing — with Operator No Bid  |Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $675.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize 200i Model $700.00 Per Hour 10 hrs  Min to Mobilize Model
(#3 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $27,000.00 Per Week | 48 hrs  Availability Wirtgen  |Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Hydraulic Track Excavator Medium — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $145.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize 160 LC Model No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#4 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $5,800.00 Per Week | 48 hrs Availability Hyundai Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Hydraulic Track Excavator Large — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $175.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize 325 Model No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#5 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $7,000.00 Per Week | 1 week Availability CAT Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Track Type Dozer Small — with Operator No Bid |Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $145.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize 550 Model| No Bid Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#6 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $5,800.00 Per Week | 48 hrs  Availability John Deere |Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Track Type Dozer Large — with Operator No Bid |Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $165.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize D-65 Model| No Bid Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#7 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $6,600.00 Per Week | 1week Availability Komatsu |Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Compaction Roller 20 Ton Capacity — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $130.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize HD 110 Model No Bid Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#8 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $5,200.00 Per Week | 48 hrs | Availability Hamm Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Road Widener — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $205.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  Min to Mobilize W 330 Model| NoBid Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#9 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $8,200.00 Per Week | 48 hrs | Availability Wieler Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Mechanical Street Sweeper — with Operator No Bid  |Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $155.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  Min to Mobilize M6 Avalanche Model No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#10 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $6,200.00 Per Week | 48 hrs  Availability Schwarze |Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Motor Grader — with Operator No Bid |Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $155.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize 720 Model| No Bid | Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#11 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $6,200.00 Per Week | 48 hrs Availability Volvo Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Backhoe Loader — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $135.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  Min to Mobilize LB 95 Model| NoBid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#12 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $5,400.00 Per Week | 48 hrs Availability New Holland Make | NoBid Per Week Availability Make
Wheel Loader — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $135.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  Min to Mobilize 624 Model| NoBid Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#13 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $5,400.00 Per Week | 48 hrs  Availability John Deere |Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Self-Propelled Asphalt Paver 5 to 9 feet — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $205.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize 8550 Model No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#14 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $8,200.00 Per Week | 1 week Availability LeeBoy |Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Self-Propelled Asphalt Paver 8 to 15 feet — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $265.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize 5103 Model $400.00 Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#15 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $10,600.00 Per Week | 48 hrs  Availability Vogele  Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Self-Propelled Asphalt Paver 10 to 20 feet — with Operator No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $375.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize 1110 Model No Bid Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#16 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $15,000.00 Per Week | 1 week Availability Champion |Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Tractor with Broom Attachment — with Operator No Bid  |Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model $125.00 Per Hour 8 hrs  |Min to Mobilize DT 80 Model No Bid  Per Hour Min to Mobilize Model
(#17 on Spec List) NoBid |Per Week Availability Make | $5,000.00 Per Week | 48 hrs | Availability Superior  Make | NoBid |Per Week Availability Make
Additional Operators No Bid |Per Hour $96.00 Per Hour No Bid |Per Hour
Additional Laborers No Bid |Per Hour $86.00 Per Hour No Bid |Per Hour

($1,000 Bid Bond)

Bid Bond X | X X




City of North Royalton Service Department
2023 Road Maintenance Program

Bidders Tabulation - EQUIPMENT & GENERAL PAVEMENT SERVICES CONTINUED

Bid Opening on Wednesday, February 22, 2023 at 10:00 am
at North Royalton City Hall, 14600 State Rd

Set In Stone Contracting, LLC

Crossroads Asphalt Recycling Inc

Geauga Highway Co

Description Unit Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Crafco Polyfiber Sealant
ODOT I LB No Bid $1.50 No Bid
OoDOT 1l LB No Bid $1.60 No Bid
ODOT IV LB No Bid $1.70 No Bid
Partial Depth Joint Repair
Grind Longitudinal Joint by the Lineal Foot 12"} LF No Bid $4.50 $9.00

24”| LF No Bid $5.50 $15.00

i i ) 12| LF No Bid $4.50 No Bid

Grind Transverse Joint or Crack by the Lineal Foot : :

24" LF No Bid $5.50 No Bid
Fill with 448 Type | Asphaltic Concrete by the Cubic Yard CUYD No Bid $505.00 $400.00
ODOT Approved Type |, Il, or IV Cracksealer LB No Bid $1.80 No Bid
Full Depth Recycling
Full Depth Recycling SQ YD No Bid $5.50 No Bid
CMS-2B by the Gallon GAL No Bid $4.25 No Bid
Sub-Base Removal & Replacement CUYD No Bid $40.00 No Bid
Alternate: ODOT #304 Limestone Added & Blended CUYD No Bid $49.00 No Bid
Cement or Lime Stabilization
Testing, Recycling & Blending of Material by the Square Yard SQ YD No Bid $7.00 No Bid
Portland Cement TON No Bid $205.00 No Bid
Quicklime TON No Bid $245.00 No Bid
Hydrated Lime TON No Bid $255.00 No Bid
Full Depth Asphalt Repair
Asphalt Repairs SQFT No Bid $40.00 $8.00
Berm Rehabilitation
Shoulder Preparation SQ YD No Bid $4.00 No Bid
Installation of Shoulder Material CUYD No Bid $50.00 No Bid
Prime Coat MC 30 GAL No Bid $4.50 No Bid
CRS-2 Asphalt Emulsion GAL No Bid $4.25 $3.00
#8 Limestone CU YD No Bid $69.00 $100.00
ODOT #409
Single Surface Treatment SQ YD No Bid $2.25 $2.45
Double Surface Treatment SQ YD No Bid $4.05 $4.50
Asphaltic Concrete Placement
ODOT #301 (material only) CUYD No Bid $138.00 No Bid
ODOT #448 Type 2 (material only) CUYD No Bid $145.00 No Bid
ODOT #448 Type 1 (material only) CUYD No Bid $169.00 No Bid
Paver, material, trucking, compaction and labor shall be billed at their per unit hourly rates.
Tack Material
ODOT Spec CSS-1 GAL No Bid $3.80 No Bid
Non-Tracking Tack GAL No Bid $4.00 No Bid

($1,000 Bid Bond)
Bid Bond | X X X




ORDINANCE NO. 23-32 INTRODUCED BY: Krejci, Barath, Marnecheck

AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF INDEPENDENCE CEMENT, LLC FOR THE 2023
ROAD MAINTENANCE PROGRAM AS THE LOWEST AND BEST BID,
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The City of North Royalton has advertised for bids for the 2023 road maintenance program;
and

WHEREAS: It has been determined that the bid of Independence Cement, LLC for concrete repairs is the
lowest and best bid; and

WHEREAS: Council desires to accept this bid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. The bid of Independence Cement, LLC for concrete repairs is hereby accepted as the lowest and
best bid as set forth in Exhibit A attached hereto and incorporated as if fully rewritten.

Section 2. The Mayor is hereby authorized to enter into a contract with Independence Cement, LLC in a form
approved by the Director of Law.

Section 3. The Service Director is hereby authorized and directed to forward a certified copy of this
Ordinance to Independence Cement, LLC and all certified checks and bonds are hereby authorized to be
returned to the unsuccessful bidders.

Section 4. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 5. This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to provide for concrete repairs for the 2023 road maintenance program in the City of
North Royalton.

THEREFORE, provided this Ordinance receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor;
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



City of North Royalton Service Department
2023 Road Maintenance Program
Bidders Tabulation - CONCRETE REPAIRS

Bid Opening on Wednesday, February 22, 2023 at 10:00 am

at North Royalton City Hall, 14600 State Rd

Set In Stone Contracting, LLC Independence Cement, LLC
Description ST Unit Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost
Usage

Full Depth Concrete Removal, Disposal & g’
Replacement Slab 3,550 SY $102.50 $363,875.00 $85.00 $301,750.00
(TO INCLUDE: Barricading, Saw Cutting, Subbase
Removal, Disposal, Replacement & Compaction, 1"
Curb, Manhole, Monument Box or Water Valve 50 SY $135.00 $6,750.00 $125.00 $6,250.00

. Slab
Adjusted to Grade)
Full Depth Concrete Joint Removal, Disposal & 8”
Replacement (minimum 3' width) Joint 230 sY $112.00 $25,760.00 $92.00 $21,160.00
(TO INCLUDE: Barricading, Saw Cutting, Subbase | Repair
Removal, Disposal, Replacement & Compaction, 12"
Curb, Manhole, Monument Box or Water Valve Joint 110 SY $150.00 $16,500.00 $128.00 $14,080.00
Adjusted to Grade) Repair
Handicap Curb Ramps Removal, Disposal &
Replacement 6"
48" X 24” ArmorTile ADA Sidewalk Ramp, with Deoth 12 EA $775.00 $9,300.00 $400.00 $4,800.00
Truncated dome (Model #22144, Color-Red) P
(To include Wire Mesh, W2.9 X W2.9, 6” x 6”)
Sidewalk Removal, Disposal & Replacement 4’
(To include Wire Mesh, W2.9 x W2.9, 6" x 6”) Depth 20 SY $90.00 $1,800.00 $70.00 $1,400.00
Additional Cost for ODOT MS Concrete 100 CY $10.00 $1,000.00 $8.00 $800.00
GRAND TOTAL ALL ESTIMATED CONCRETE WORK $424,985.00 $350,240.00

(10% Bid Bond)

Bid Bond




ORDINANCE NO. 23-33 INTRODUCED BY: Marnecheck, Wos, Barath

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN AMENDMENT TO THE
AGREEMENT WITH TYLER TECHNOLOGIES, INC. AS AMENDED BY ORDINANCE 22-77 FOR THE
FURNISHING, DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION OF COMPUTER HARDWARE AND SOFTWARE
AND OTHER SERVICES FOR A FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT INFORMATION AND APPLICATIONS
SYSTEM FOR THE FINANCIAL FUNCTIONS OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, FOR AN
AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $55,869.37, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: Tyler Technologies, Inc. and the City of North Royalton are parties to an agreement dated
February 10, 2009 (Ordinance 09-13); and

WHEREAS: Tyler Technologies, Inc. and the City of North Royalton desire to amend the terms of the
Agreement, as amended by Ordinance 22-77; and

WHEREAS: Tyler Technologies, Inc. has adjusted the annual maintenance fees currently due for the Tyler
Enterprise ERP Software for the maintenance term commencing April 23, 2023, and ending
April 22, 2024; and

WHEREAS: Council desires to authorize the Mayor to enter into an amendment to the agreement.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. Council hereby authorizes the Mayor to enter into an amendment to the agreement with Tyler
Technologies, Inc. for the maintenance of a Financial Management Information and Applications System for
the financial functions of the City of North Royalton for an amount not to exceed $55,869.37, pursuant to
terms and conditions approved by the Director of Law.

Section 2. The Director of Finance is hereby authorized and directed to forward a certified copy of this Ordinance
to Tyler Technologies, Inc.

Section 3. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 4. This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to provide for maintenance of a Financial Management Information and Applications
System for the financial functions of the City of North Royalton.

THEREFORE, provided this Ordinance receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor; otherwise,
from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



Remittance:

Tyler Technologies, Inc
(FEIN 75-2303920)
P.O. Box 203556
Dallas, TX 75320-3556

. tyler

technologies

Questions:
Tyler Technologies- ERP & Schools

Phone:

Bill T CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON [
ATTN: ACCOUNTING
14600 STATE ROAD

NORTH ROYALTON, OH44133 NORTH ROYALTON

1-800-772-2260 Press 2, then 1

™ RECEIVED

F-2 9 7 202%hip To

FINANCE DEPARTMENT

Invoice

Date
03/01/2023

Invoice No
045-409998

CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON
ATTN: ACCOUNTING

14600 STATE ROAD

NORTH ROYALTON, OH44133

Page
1 of 1

[Cust No.-BillTo-ShipTo  Ord No PO Number Currency Terms Due Date 1
6651 - MAIN - MAIN 186079 UsD NET30 03/31/2023
Date Description Units Rate Extended Price
Contract No.: NORTH ROYALTON, OH
SUPPORT & UPDATE LICENSING - ACCTG/GL/BUDGET/AP 1 16,058.56 16,058.56
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
SUPPORT & UPDATE LICENSING - ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 1 3,380.13 3,380.13
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
SUPPORT & UPDATE LICENSING - GENERAL BILLING 1 1,636.52 1,636.52
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
SUPPORT & UPDATE LICENSING - MUNIS OFFICE 1 2,610.80 2,610.80
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
SUPPORT & UPDATE LICENSING - PURCHASE ORDERS 1 3,688.29 3,688.29
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
SUPPORT & UPDATE LICENSING - ROLE TAILORED DASHBOARD 1 2,610.80 2,610.80
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
SUPPORT & UPDATE LICENSING - TYLER CONTENT MANAGER 1 3,073.04 3,073.04
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
TYLER FORM PROCESSING SUPPORT 1 3,415.44 3,415.44
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
GUI UNLIMITED LICENSE SUPPORT 1 2,700.00 2,700.00
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
TYLER SYSTEM MANAGEMENT SERVICES SUPPORT 1 12,053.55 12,053.55
Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024
SUPPORT & UPDATE LICENSING - BUSINESS OBJECTS 1 4,742.24 4,742.24

Maintenance: Start: 23/Apr/2023, End: 22/Apr/2024

*ATTENTION**
Order your checks and forms from
Tyler Business Forms at 877-749-2090 or
tylerbusinessforms.com to guarantee

100% compliance with your software.

Subtotal | 55,869.37 I

0.00

Invoice Total | 55,869.37 I

Sales Tax




ORDINANCE NO. 23-34 INTRODUCED BY: Krejci, Barath, Marnecheck

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE
CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON AND HINCKLEY TOWNSHIP FOR THE RESURFACING AND REPAIR
OF BOSTON ROAD EAST OF RIDGE ROAD, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The Ohio Revised Code, including Section 9.482 provides that any political subdivision may
enter into an agreement with another political subdivision to exercise any power, perform any
function or render any service for the contracting subdivision; and

WHEREAS: The Parties agree that it is necessary to resurface and repair Boston Road east of Ridge Road
that is the boundary line road between Hinckley Township and the City of North Royalton;
and

WHEREAS: The Parties find and agree that it is in their best interest to jointly resurface and repair said
portion of Boston Road and to proportionally share in the expense and they desire to complete
the Project in a timely manner whereby the City will pay at the rate of 50% of the total cost of
the project ("City Funds™), and Hinckley Township will pay 50% of the total cost of the
project ("Township Funds") as more fully defined below and in the exhibits attached hereto
and incorporated herein by reference. The Township will construct the repair and resurfacing
in compliance with all laws of the Township and the State of Ohio applicable to public
improvements; and

WHEREAS:  Council desires to authorize the Mayor to enter into an agreement with the City of North
Royalton and Hinckley Township for the resurfacing and repair of Boston Road east of Ridge
Road.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON,
COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. Council hereby authorizes the Mayor to enter into an agreement with the City of North Royalton
and Hinckley Township for the resurfacing and repair of Boston Road east of Ridge Road, pursuant to terms
and conditions approved by the Director of Law and substantially similar to a copy of which is attached hereto
as Exhibit A and incorporated as if fully rewritten.

Section 2. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the
adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this
Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in
compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 3. This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the
preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is
immediately necessary to authorize the Mayor enter into an agreement with the City of North Royalton and
Hinckley Township for the resurfacing and repair of Boston Road east of Ridge Road so that work can
commence.

THEREFORE, provided this Ordinance receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to
Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor;
otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL MAYOR

DATE PASSED: DATE APPROVED:

ATTEST:
DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE SERVICES

YEAS:

NAYS:



BOSTON ROAD REPAIR AGREEMENT

THIS AGREEMENT ("Agreement") is entered into this day of , 2023
("Effective Date") between the CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON ("City"), a municipal
corporation and political subdivision organized and validly existing under the laws of the State of

Ohio, pursuant to authority of Ordinance No. , passed , 2023,

a copy of which is attached hereto as Exhibit A, and Hinckley Township ("Township"), an
unincorporated political subdivision organized and validly existing under the laws of the State of

Ohio, pursuant to authority by Motion, passed , 2023 a copy of which is

attached hereto as Exhibit B.

WHEREAS, the Ohio Revised Code, including Section 9.482 provides that any
political subdivision may enter into an agreement with another political subdivision to
exercise any power, perform any function or render any service for the contracting
subdivision; and

WHEREAS, the Parties agree that it is necessary to resurface and repair Boston Road
east of Ridge Road that is the boundary line road between Hinckley Township and the City
of North Royalton; and

WHEREAS, The Parties find and agree that it is in their best interest to jointly
resurface and repair said portion of Boston Road and to proportionally share in the expense
and they desire to complete the Project in a timely manner whereby the City will pay at the
rate of 50% of the total cost of the project ("City Funds"), and Hinckley Township will pay
50% of the total cost of the project ("Township Funds") as more fully defined below and in
the exhibits attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference. The Township will
construct the repair and resurfacing in compliance with all laws of the Township and the

State of Ohio applicable to public improvements.

Page 1 of 11



NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual covenants contained herein and
intending to be legally bound, the Parties hereby enter into this Agreement and agree to the

following:

I DESCRIPTION OF THE PROJECT.

A. The project involves the repair and resurfacing of Boston Road east from Ridge
Road to a point where it dead ends into the driveway of a City residence at 6600 Boston Road,
North Royalton, Oho ("Project"). Boston Road in the area described serves as the boundary
Road between the City and the Township. A portion of the road to be repaired lies wholly within
the City. The Project will be constructed in accordance with the plans and specifications
prepared by the Medina County Engineer’s Office ("Project Plans"), following approval of same
by the City's Engineer. Any changes to the Project Plans occurring after the City Engineer’s
approval as stated in this paragraph shall only be effective upon approval of the City Engineer,
which shall not be unreasonably withheld or delayed. The Township agrees to assemble the
plans, specifications, and bid documents and to bid the project awarding the bid to the lowest
responsible bidder. The Township will manage the project and will be responsible for
reviewing pay requests, change orders, approving the same with the review and approval of

the City, and issuing any payments.

IL. FUNDING.

A. The total estimated cost of the project is $46,160.00 as specified in the estimates
from the Township and the Medina County Engineering Office (Exhibit C). The total cost to
repair and resurface such portion of Boston Road may increase or decrease and will not be
known until project completion. Said cost shall be paid equally by the City and the Township at
the rate of 50% each for the repair and resurfacing cost including any change orders that may be

entered into by the Township for the road improvement as hereinafter provided.
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B. Payments by the City to the Township, as detailed above under shall be equal to
fifty percent (50%) for the road improvement on Boston Road less the total of all previous
payments. Payments shall require submission by the Township of a detailed fee invoice to City
and approval of said billing by City. Payments shall be due and payable within thirty (30) days
after the Township’s submission of an invoice. After receipt of the invoice by City, should part
of the bill be contested, the balance of approved items will be approved for payment, and
contested items resolved prior to the next billing.

C. The City is not liable for payment of any administrative or engineering costs
unless specifically authorized by Council.

D. The Township shall pay 50% of the actual repair and resurfacing cost and all

administrative and engineering costs for the project.

III. GENERAL PROVISIONS

A. Performance of Township

It is understood that Township, without expense to City shall:

Allow City access to all available existing information, including reports, plans of the
existing roadways and utility and signal systems, and other data in the engineering files which

may be pertinent to the work.

Allow City to examine any studies, reports, sketches, estimates, drawings, specifications,
proposals and other documents relative to the project and render decisions pertaining thereto

within a reasonable time in order not to delay the work.

B. Performance by City

It is understood that City, without expense to Township shall:

Allow the Township access to all available existing information, including reports, plans

of the existing roadways and utility and signal systems, and other data in the engineering fields
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which may be pertinent to the work.

Allow the Township to examine any studies, report, sketches, estimates, drawings,
specifications, proposals, and other documents relative to the project and render decisions

pertaining thereto within a reasonable time in order not to delay the work.

C. Documents and Records

The Township shall retain title and ownership to any plans, drawings, charts, reports,
illustrations and field notes or other similar data developed during the work and covered by this

Agreement in relation to the repair and resurfacing of Boston Road.

D. Trade and Technical Words

All trade and technical words and terms used in this Agreement shall be deemed to have
the meaning established by trade usage in the highway/bridge/traffic construction and consultant

engineer business.

IV. CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS, CITY APPROVALS.

A. The Township agrees to prepare all necessary documents, engineering drawings,
plans, specifications, engineering estimates, bidding documents, forms, notices, bonds and
contracts for the Project and shall submit the Plans and specifications including the form of
contract to the City Engineer and the City Law Director for review and approval which shall not
be unreasonably delayed or withheld. The Engineer shall provide comments to the Township
immediately upon receipt of the documents from the Township. Any questions shall be resolved
expeditiously. Bid tabulations for the project shall be submitted to the City Engineer who shall

be consulted for approval prior to award of construction contracts for the project.

V. INSPECTIONS

A. All inspections shall be completed by the Township or its representative.
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VI. TERMINATION
A. If the cost of the Project exceeds the estimates by more than 10%, either Party

may terminate this Agreement.

VII. LEGISLATIVE AUTHORITY
A. The Parties agree that the person(s) signing this Agreement has/have been

authorized by appropriate legislative action by their respective legislative authorities.

VIII. OHIO LAW APPLIES

A. This Agreement shall be construed under and in accordance with the laws of the

State of Ohio.

IX. BINDING ON SUCCESSORS
A. This Agreement shall be binding on the parties and their office holders, officials,

employees, agents, successors and assigns.

X. COMPLETE AGREEMENT

A. This Agreement sets forth the entire agreement among the Parties and supersedes
any prior discussions, negotiations, or representations among them regarding its subject matter.
This Agreement also supersedes any prior past practices between the Parties. No additions or
changes to this Agreement shall be made or be binding on any party unless made in writing and

signed by each party.
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XI. SEVERABILITY

A. If any one or more of the provisions contained in this Agreement shall for any
reason be held to be invalid, illegal, and/or unenforceable in any respect, such invalidity,
illegality, and/or unenforceability shall not affect any other provision hereof, and this Agreement

shall be construed as if such clause had never been contained herein.

XII. AUTHORIZATION

The undersigned representatives of each of the parties hereby represent and warrant that
he/she is the duly authorized officer or agent of such party, that each party has approved this
agreement by appropriate legal and/or legislative action, and that this agreement constitutes a
valid and binding contract and agreement properly undertaken and binding upon each of the

parties.
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IN WITNESS WHEREOQOF, the Parties hereto have executed, or caused to be executed
by their duly authorized officials, this agreement in duplicate, each of which shall be deemed

an original on the date first above written.

CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON

BY:

WITNESS
PRINT:

TITLE:

DATE:

HINCKLEY TOWNSHIP BOARD OF TRUSTEES

TRUSTEE WITNESS
TRUSTEE WITNESS
TRUSTEE WITNESS
DATE:
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Approved as to form
And Correctness

S. Forrest Thompson

Brian M. Richter

Assistant Prosecuting Attorney

Approved as to

Form and Correctness

City of North Royalton

Law Director
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Exhibit A

City of North Royalton Ordinance
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Exhibit B

Hinckley Township Motion
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Exhibit C

Medina County Engineering Office project estimate

PROPOSALNO. 2 of 3 Proposals ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE
To the Board of The Hinckley Twp. Trustees:

The undersigned, having full knowledge of the site and specifications for the following proposal, hereby agrees
to fumnish all services, labor, material and equipment necessary to complete said proposal as specified by the
stipulated completion date(s). The undersigned further agrees to accept this total amount bid (based on estimated
quantities) and understands that actual payment may vary according to actual quantities used. The unit prices bid
shall be applied to actual quantities of materials used to form the basis of final payment. The total of said payments
for all individual proposals will not exceed the total amount awarded for the entire contract.

Date of Bid Opening: P.M., Ohio Time

Date of Final Completion:

For improving: T.H. 13 Boston Road Section: S.R. 3 Ridge Road to End

Materials identified by 2019 State of Ohio, Department of Transportation, Construction and Material
Specifications, January 1, Edition shall prevail.

Length: 2,860 (Feet) Length: 0.54 (Miles)
Width: 19.0 (Feet) Aggr. Rate: 33 (Lbs/SY)
Mainline: 6,038 (Sq. Yds.) CRS-2 Rate: 0.45 (Gals/SY)
Intersections: 27 (Sq. Yds.)
Total Area: 6,065 (Sq. Yds.)
ltem Quantity Units ltem Description Unit Cost | Total Cost
253 85 Cu. Yds. 301 Pavement Repairs — 4" Depth $300.00 $25,500.00
CRS-2 Bituminious Latex Modified Seal Coat
422 2,730 Gals Applied at 0.45 Gals/SY $3.00 $8,190.00
No. 57 Limestone Cover Aggregate Loaded,
422 105 Tons Hauled, Spread & Rolled @ 33 Lbs/SY $70.00 $7,350.00
642 20 Feet Stop Line, Type 1 SS.QO $120.00
614 1 Lump Sum |Traffic Control $5,000.00 $5,000.00
Grand Total - $46,160.00
Submitted By: Date:

Andrew J. Conrad P.E., P.S.
Medina County Engineer

Page 11 of 11




	MARCH 2023
	AGENDA 030723
	A G E N D A
	MARCH 7, 2023
	REGULAR ORDER OF BUSINESS

	23-025 Mayor photos - Historical Society
	23-026 prerecession levels
	23-027 1 FF appoint - Kotar
	23-028 2 FF appoint - Hardy
	23-029 3 FF appoint - Beno
	23-030 American - pavement marking
	23-030 American - pavement marking EXHIBIT A
	23-031 Crossroads - equipment
	23-031 Crossroads - equipment EXHIBIT A
	23-032 Independence - concrete
	23-032 Independence - concrete EXHIBIT A
	23-033 Munis invoice
	23-033 Munis invoice EXHIBIT
	23-034 Boston Road
	23-034 Boston Road EXHIBIT A

