JANUARY 2024						
SUNDAY	MONDAY	TUESDAY	WEDNESDAY	THURSDAY	FRIDAY	SATURDAY
	1 NEW YEAR'S DAY	STREETS AND	3 PLANNING COMMISSION CAUCUS 6:45PM MEETING 7PM	4	5	6
7	8 CIVIL SERVICE 4PM	9	10	11	12	13
14	15 MARTIN LUTHER KING JR DAY	16 B&BC, FINANCE AND SAFETY 6PM COUNCIL 7PM	17	18	19	20
21	22	23	24	25 BOARD OF ZONING CAUCUS 6:45PM MEETING 7PM	26	27
28	29	30 REC BOARD 6PM	31			

NORTH ROYALTON CITY COUNCIL A G E N D A JANUARY 16, 2024

Council Meeting 7:00 p.m.

REGULAR ORDER OF BUSINESS

1. Call to Order.

7:00 p.m. Caucus

- 2. Opening Ceremony (Pledge of Allegiance).
- 3. Roll Call.
- 4. Approval of Consent Agenda: Items listed under the Consent Agenda are considered routine. Each item will be read individually into the record and the Consent Agenda will then be enacted as a whole by one motion and one roll call. There will be no separate discussion of these items. If discussion by Council is desired on any Consent Agenda item, or if discussion is requested by the public on any legislative item on the Consent Agenda, that item will be removed from the Consent Agenda and considered in its normal sequence under the Regular Order of Business.
 - a. Approval of Minutes: December 19, 2023
 - b. Legislation: Introduce, suspend rules requiring 3 readings and referral to committee, and adopt those legislative items indicated with an asterisk (*).
 - c. Authorizing the Mayor and Director of Public Services and Properties to advertise for bids for the 2024 Road Maintenance Program.
 - d. Authorizing the Mayor and Director of Public Services and Properties to advertise for bids for the Residential Solid Waste Collection, Disposal and Recycling Services.
 - e. Authorizing the Mayor and Wastewater Superintendent to advertise for bids for the Abbey Road Force Main and Gravity Sewer Project.
 - f. Authorizing the Mayor and Wastewater Superintendent to advertise for bids for process chemicals.
- 5. Communications.
- 6. Mayor's Report.
- 7. Department Head Reports.
- 8. President of Council's Report.
- 9. Committee Reports:

Building & Building Codes
Finance
Review & Oversight
Safety
Storm Water
Streets
Utilities
John Nickell
Paul Marnecheck
Heidi Webber
Michael Wos
Linda Barath
Joanne Krejci
Mary Gorjanc

10. Report from Council Representatives to regulatory or other boards:

Board of Zoning Appeals

Planning Commission

Paul Marnecheck
Recreation Board

Linda Barath

- 11. Public Discussion: Five minute maximum on current agenda legislation only.
- 12. LEGISLATION

FIRST READING CONSIDERATION

- * 1. **24-15** A RESOLUTION ACKNOWLEDGING THE COMMUNITY SERVICE OF GENE BAXENDALE.
 - 2. **24-16** A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR'S APPOINTMENT OF FRANK CASTROVILLARI AS A MEMBER OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON PLANNING COMMISSION EFFECTIVE FEBRUARY 7, 2024, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

- 3. **24-17** A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR'S APPOINTMENT OF VINCENT WEIMER AS A MEMBER OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON'S BOARD OF ZONING APPEALS, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.
- 4. **24-18** A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE APPOINTMENT OF RUSSELL WELLS AS A MEMBER OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON'S BOARD OF ZONING APPEALS, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.
- 5. **24-19** AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE 22-50 AUTHORIZING THE RECEIPT FOR DONATIONS/FUNDS FOR THE NORTH ROYALTON CITY SPONSORED EVENTS BY SPECIFYING TWO ADDITIONAL CITY SPONSORED EVENTS, THE SOLAR ECLIPSE BASH, AND THE TOUCH-A-TRUCK POLICE NIGHT OUT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.
- 6. **24-20** AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF PORTS PETROLEUM FOR THE PURCHASE OF FUEL FOR THE 2024 SEASON AS THE LOWEST AND BEST BID, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.
- 13. Miscellaneous.
- 14. Adjournment.

RESOLUTION NO. 24-15 INTRODUCED BY: Mayor Antoskiewicz

A RESOLUTION ACKNOWLEDGING THE COMMUNITY SERVICE OF GENE BAXENDALE

WHEREAS: Gene Baxendale was appointed to the City of North Royalton Planning Commission on March

28, 2018 and continued to serve in that capacity through January 19, 2024; and

<u>WHEREAS</u>: Mr. Baxendale served courteously and skillfully as the Chairman of the Planning Commission

from February 3, 2021 to January 19, 2024, treating all parties with respect and dignity in the

highest traditions of public service; and

WHEREAS: Council and Mayor Antoskiewicz desire to recognize Mr. Baxendale for his community

service to the City of North Royalton.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

<u>Section 1</u>. The Council of the City of North Royalton and Mayor Antoskiewicz hereby acknowledge Gene Baxendale for all his years of community service to the City of North Royalton.

<u>Section 2</u>. Council and the Mayor further recognize the professionalism, dedication and community spirit demonstrated by Mr. Baxendale during his years of public service to the City of North Royalton.

<u>Section 3</u>. The Acting Clerk of Council is authorized and directed to forward a copy of this Resolution to Mr. Baxendale in recognition of his community service.

THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of a majority of all members elected to Council, it shall take effect and be in force from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL	APPROVED:	MAYOR
DATE PASSED:	DATE APPROVED:	
ATTEST:ACTING CLERK OF COUNCIL	First reading Second reading Third reading	
YEAS:		
NAYS:		

RESOLUTION NO. 24-16

INTRODUCED BY: Mayor Antoskiewicz

A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR'S APPOINTMENT OF FRANK CASTROVILLARI AS A MEMBER OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON PLANNING COMMISSION EFFECTIVE FEBRUARY 7, 2024, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The Mayor has appointed Frank Castrovillari to serve as a member of the City of North

Royalton Planning Commission; and

WHEREAS: Council confirms various appointments made by the Mayor; and

WHEREAS: It is necessary to keep an accurate record of these various appointments as to individuals

appointed and their term of office.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

<u>Section 1</u>. Council hereby confirms the appointment of Frank Castrovillari as a member of the City of North Royalton Planning Commission effective February 7, 2024.

Section 2. The term of said appointment shall expire on February 6, 2027.

<u>Section 3</u>. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements.

<u>Section 4</u>. This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is immediately necessary to keep accurate public records as to the various appointments made by the Mayor and the date of said appointments.

THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor; otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

	APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL	MAYOR
DATE PASSED:	DATE APPROVED:
ATTEST:ACTING CLERK OF COUNCIL	First reading Second reading Third reading
YEAS:	
NAYS:	

RESOLUTION NO. 24-17

INTRODUCED BY: Mayor Antoskiewicz

A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE MAYOR'S APPOINTMENT OF VINCENT WEIMER AS A MEMBER OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON'S BOARD OF ZONING APPEALS, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The Mayor has appointed Vincent Weimer to a full term on the City of North Royalton's Board

of Zoning Appeals; and

WHEREAS: Council confirms various appointments made by the Mayor; and

<u>WHEREAS</u>: It is necessary to keep an accurate record of these various appointments as to individuals

appointed and their term of office.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

<u>Section 1</u>. Council hereby confirms the appointment of Vincent Weimer to fill a three-year term to the City of North Royalton's Board of Zoning Appeals, effective January 20, 2024.

Section 2. The term of said appointment shall expire on January 19, 2027.

<u>Section 3</u>. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements.

<u>Section 4.</u> This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is immediately necessary to keep accurate public records as to the various appointments made by the Mayor and the date of said appointments.

THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor; otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

	APPROVED:	
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL		MAYOR
DATE PASSED:	DATE APPROVED:	
ATTEST:ACTING CLERK OF COUNCIL	First reading Second reading Third reading	
YEAS:		
NAYS:		

RESOLUTION NO. 24-18

INTRODUCED BY: Mayor Antoskiewicz

A RESOLUTION CONFIRMING THE APPOINTMENT OF RUSSELL WELLS AS A MEMBER OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON'S BOARD OF ZONING APPEALS, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The Mayor has appointed Russell Wells to a full term on the City of North Royalton's Board of

Zoning Appeals; and

WHEREAS: Council confirms various appointments made by the Mayor; and

<u>WHEREAS</u>: It is necessary to keep an accurate record of these various appointments as to individuals

appointed and their term of office.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

<u>Section 1</u>. Council hereby confirms the appointment of Russell Wells to a three-year term on the City of North Royalton's Board of Zoning Appeals, effective February 7, 2024.

<u>Section 2</u>. The term of said appointment shall expire on February 6, 2027.

<u>Section 3</u>. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements.

<u>Section 4.</u> This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is immediately necessary to keep accurate public records as to the various appointments made by the Mayor and the date of said appointments.

THEREFORE, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor; otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

	APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL	MAYOR
DATE PASSED:	DATE APPROVED:
ATTEST:ACTING CLERK OF COUNCIL	First reading Second reading Third reading
YEAS:	
NAYS:	

ORDINANCE NO. 24-19

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE 22-50 AUTHORIZING THE RECEIPT FOR DONATIONS/FUNDS FOR THE NORTH ROYALTON CITY SPONSORED EVENTS BY SPECIFYING TWO ADDITIONAL CITY SPONSORED EVENTS, THE SOLAR ECLIPSE BASH, AND THE TOUCHA-TRUCK POLICE NIGHT OUT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

INTRODUCED BY: Mayor Antoskiewicz

WHEREAS: The City of North Royalton sponsors certain city events; and
WHEREAS: Council has provided funds for the support of those events; and
WHEREAS: Council approved Ordinance 22-50 authorizing the receipt for donations/funds for the North Royalton city sponsored events; and
WHEREAS: It is necessary to amend Ordinance 22-50 by specifying an additional city sponsored events known as The Solar Eclipse Bash; and
WHEREAS: It is necessary to amend Ordinance 22-50 by specifying an additional city sponsored events known as Touch-a-Truck Police Night Out; and
WHEREAS: Council desires to provide for this amendment.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

<u>Section 1</u>. Council hereby amends Ordinance 22-50 to receive any and all donations to the specific city sponsored events known as: North Royalton Easter Parade, Parkapalooza, Movie Nights, Fishing Derby, Car Show, Harvest Fest, Halloween Madness, Holiday Lighting and Community Festival fireworks display, Solar Eclipse Bash, Touch-a-Truck Police Night Out, and directs the Mayor to adopt such reasonable restrictions for the use of those funds as may be reasonable and/or required by law.

<u>Section 2</u>. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council, and that all deliberations of this Council, and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action, were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements.

<u>Section 3</u>. This Ordinance is an emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is necessary to amend Ordinance 22-50 to specify an additional city sponsored event to authorize receipt of these donations/funds.

THEREFORE, provided this Ordinance receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to Council, it shall take affect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor; otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

	APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL	MAYOR
DATE PASSED:	DATE APPROVED:
ATTEST:ACTING CLERK OF COUNCIL	First reading Second reading Third reading
YEAS:	
NAYS:	

ORDINANCE NO. 24-20 INTRODUCED BY: Krejci, Marnecheck, Gorjanc

AN ORDINANCE ACCEPTING THE BID OF PORTS PETROLEUM FOR THE PURCHASE OF FUEL FOR THE 2024 SEASON AS THE LOWEST AND BEST BID, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS: The City of North Royalton is authorized to purchase fuel through its membership in the Joint

Municipal Improvement Consortium (JMIC) which generally occurs at a lower rate than if

purchased on the open market; and

WHEREAS: The JMIC follows competitive bidding requirements as set forth in the Ohio Revised Code; and

WHEREAS: The bids submitted to the JMIC were obtained in compliance with the competitive bidding

requirements of the Ohio Revised Code and Charter of the City of North Royalton.

WHEREAS: Council wishes to accept the contract price of Ports Petroleum for fuel for the 2024 season; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON, COUNTY OF CUYAHOGA AND STATE OF OHIO, THAT:

Section 1. The bid of Ports Petroleum, obtained through the Joint Municipal Improvement Consortium, for fuel to be supplied for 2024 to the City of North Royalton for Unleaded 87 Octane (transport) and ULS #2 Diesel (transport), with the option of renewal for year 2025, as set forth in Exhibit A, and which is in accordance with the specifications on file in the Office of the Director of Public Service and Properties, is hereby accepted as the lowest and best bid.

Section 2. The Mayor is hereby authorized and directed to enter into a contract on behalf of the City of North Royalton with Ports Petroleum which shall be in accordance with the bid and specifications as set forth in Section 1 hereof, said contract to be in such form as is approved by the Director of Law.

Section 3. The Director of Public Service and Properties is hereby authorized and directed to forward a certified copy of this Ordinance to Ports Petroleum and all certified checks and bonds are hereby authorized to be returned to the unsuccessful bidders.

Section 4. This Ordinance shall supersede all previously adopted ordinances in direct conflict herewith.

Section 5. It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and relating to the adoption of this Ordinance were adopted in an open meeting of this Council and that all deliberations of this Council and any of its committees that resulted in such formal action were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements.

Section 6. This Ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency measure immediately necessary for the preservation of the public peace, health, safety and welfare of the city, and for the further reason that it is immediately necessary to provide for the purchase of fuel.

THEREFORE, provided this Ordinance receives the affirmative vote of two-thirds of all members elected to Council, it shall take effect and be in force immediately upon its passage and approval by the Mayor; otherwise, from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

	APPROVED:
PRESIDENT OF COUNCIL	MAYOR
DATE PASSED:	DATE APPROVED:
ATTEST:ACTING CLERK OF COUNCIL	First reading Second reading Third reading
YEAS:	
NAYS:	



City of North Royalton

Mayor Larry Antoskiewicz

Nick Cinquepalmi

Service Director

Service Department 440-582-3002 fax 440-582-3089

TO:

Streets Committee -

Joanne Krejci, Chair

Linda Barath, Vice Chair

Paul Marnecheck

FROM:

Nick Cinquepalmi, Service Director

DATE:

December 12, 2023

RE:

2024 Fuel Bid Recommendation

Please find attached bid tabulation from the Consortium bid opening on November 3, 2023 for the 2024-2025 Fuel Bid Program.

The City of North Royalton purchases Unleaded 87 Octane and ULS #2 Diesel via Transport delivery. Our underground fuel storage tanks capacity is 8,000 gallons for each fuel type. When ordering fuel, a combined minimum of 7,500 gallons between Unleaded and Diesel must be ordered.

As highlighted on the bid tabulation, Petroleum Traders submitted the lowest price differential for Unleaded 87. The savings will equate to .0176 per gallon, or approximately \$79.20 on our standard order of 4,500 gallons for Unleaded 87.

Even though the price per gallon for both fuel types will vary throughout the term of this agreement, entering into an agreement with a single supplier would prove to be a more efficient ordering process.

Therefore, I am recommending the City of North Royalton accept the bid of Ports Petroleum as the lowest and best bid for the 2024 year with option of renewal for year 2025.

If there are any questions, do not hesitate to contact me. Thanks.

/aca

Encl.

C:

Mayor Larry Antoskiewicz Council Office

File

City of Brecksville, Consortium Administrative Agency

MUNICIPAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM BID TABULATION:
SUPPLYING GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL (Brecksville, Broadview Hts, Brooklyn, Independence, Middleburg Hts, North Royalton, Seven Hills)
Year 1 Contract Term: 1/1/124-12/31/124
Year 2 Contract Term: 1/1/125-12/31/125
Bid Opening: November 3, 2023 9:00 a.m.
Present: Becki Riser, City of Brecksville, Joe Kickel, City of Brecksville

Total Cost per Gallon Calculation: Sample OPIS average + Bid Differential + Sample Taxes & Fees (as specified on Bid Form)	PETROLEUM TRADERS (different pricing Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)	PORTS PETROLEUM (different pricing Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)	WORLD FUEL SERVICES (same pricing Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bld Form)
Highlights = Apparent Low Bids (Unofficial)	Price Differential (Add)	Total SampleCost/ Gallon	Price Differential (Add)	Total SampleCost/ Gallon	Price Differential (Add)	Total SampleCost/ Gallon
NO LEAD REGULAR GRADE GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE, w/ 10% Ethanol Blend	OCTANE, w/ 10% Ethanol Blend					
Transport		Year 1: Year 2: 2.5817 2.5832	Year 1: (-0.0197) Year 2: (-0.0113)	Year 1: Year 2: 2.5993 2.6077	Year 1: (-0.0299) Year 2: (-0.0299)	Year 1: 2.5891
Tankwagon	NO BID	NO BID	Year 1: .0955 Year 2: .1055	Year 1: Year 2: 2.7145 2.7245	Year 1: .0790 Year 2: .0790	Year 1: Year 2: 2.6980 2.6980
Product Bid	Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.		Various		Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.	
Name & Location of Refiner	Marathon, Cleveland, OH		Various		Marathon, Canton, OH	
ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 DIESEL						
Transport	Year 1: (-0.0050) Year 2: (-0.0035)	Year 1: Year 2: 2.7504 2.7519	Year 1: (0.0297) Year 2: (0.0113)	Year 1: Year 2: 2.7255 2.7441	Year 1: (-0.0034) Year 2: (-0.0034)	Year 1: Year 2: 2.752
Tankwagon	NO BID	NO BID	Year 1: .0955 Year 2: .1055	Year 1: Year 2: 2.8509 2.8609	Year 1: .0790 Year 2: .0790	Year 1: Year 2: 2.8344 2.8344
Product Bid	Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.		Various	8	Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.	
Name & Location of Refiner	Marathon, Cleveland, OH		Various		Marathon, Canton, OH	
TRANSPORT DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS	ALLONS					
Gasoline	7500		7500		7500	
Diesel	7500		7500		7500	
TANKWAGON DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS	GALLONS					
Gasoline	NO BID		500		1000	
Diesel	NO BID		500		1000	
EXCEPTIONS	While we are typically able to meet next day deliveries, Pertolatur traders may request up to 48 hours from time of order in place of 36 hours as stated in bid document. Diesel Fuel will meet the ASTM D975 requirements of a Minimum 40 cetane.		Diesel will meet most current ASTIA spec. Terms Not 30, 0% discount. Less Than Minimum Delivery for TankWagon add \$200.00, for Transport add \$250.00.		None	
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS SUBMITTED	Yes		Yes		Yes	
						-

Total Cost per Gallon Calculation: Sample OPIS average + Bid Differential + Sample Taxes & Fees (as specified on Bld Form)	COLONIAL OIL INDUSTRIES (different pricing Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)	MANSFIELD OIL CO. (different pricing Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)	CUYAHOGA LANDMARK (same pricing Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bld Form)
	Price Differential (Add)	Total SampleCost/ Gallon	n Price Differential (Add)	Total SampleCost/ Gallon	Price Differential (Add)	Total SampleCost' Gallon
NO LEAD REGULAR GRADE GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE, w/	SOLINE, 87 OCTANE, w/ 10% Ethanol Blend					
Transport	Year 1: (-0.0017) Year 2: 0.0133		Year 1: .0119 Year 2: 0.0139	Year 1: Year 2: 2.6309 2.6329	Year 1: .03 Year 2: 0.03	
Tankwagon	Year 1: .1687 Year 2: .1837	Year 1: Year 2: 2.7877 2.8027	NO BID	NO BID	Year 1: .085 Year 2: .085	Year 1: Year 2: 2.704 2.704
Product Bid	arathor		No lead regular grade gasoline, 87 Octane w/ 10% ethanol blend.			
Name & Location of Refiner	Husky/BP Cleveland/Canton		Various		Various	
ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 DIESEL						
Transport	Year 1: (-0.0002) Year 2: 0.0148	Year 1: Year 2: 2.7678	Year 1: (-0.0018) Year 2: 0.0007	Year 1: Year 2: 2.7536 2.7561	Year 1: .03 Year 2: 0.03	Year 1: Year 2: 2.7854 2.7854
Tankwagon	Year 1: .1687 Year 2: .1837	Year 1: Year 2: 2.9241 2.9391	Year 1: .3763 Year 2: .3763	Year 1: Year 2: 3.1317	Year 1: .085 Year 2: .085	Year 1: Year 2: 2.8404 2.8404
Product Bid	arathon		ur #2 [
Name & Location of Refiner	Husky/BP Cleveland/Canton		Various		Various	
一日本の日本の大学の大学の大学の大学の大学の大学の大学の大学の大学の大学の大学の大学の大学の				のできる ないのうしゅう		
TRANSPORT DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS	RDER/GALLONS					
Gasoline	8500		7500		8500	
Diesel	7500		7500		7500	
TANKWAGON DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS	ORDER/GALLONS					
Gasoline	150		200		4500	
Diesel	150		200		4500	
	None		None		None	
EXCEPTIONS						
5						
	Yes		Yes		Yes	
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS SUBMITTED						

City of Brecksville, Consortium Administrative Agency

City of North Royalton, Ohio

AGREEMENT

	AGREEMENT, entered into th		
CITY "Suppl		ereinafter "Ci	ity,") and <u>PORTS PETROLEUM</u> , (hereinafter
	WI	ITNESSE	T H: That,
	WHEREAS: City has need f	for:	
THE I		THE 2024 S	SEASON, AS SPECIFIED IN ORDINANCE
			th Royalton on the basis of bids as lowest, and
	WHEREAS: Both parties ar as follows:	e desirous of	entering into a contract the terms of which are
1.	11 0 1		s and/or services detailed in the bidding in by reference, on an as needed or as required
2.	bidding specifications and if	no date of del	according to the time schedule set forth in the livery is incorporated therein, then delivery is the need of the City and availability of supply
3.	specifications and, in the abso	ence of specif	items and/or services which meet contractic payment specification set forth in the bids d/or performed as per agreement.
4.	Supplier agrees to allow the C discretion for the calendar year	•	r renewal option of the agreement at the City's
	· •	_	lly agreed upon the terms and conditions se valton, Ohio the date first above written.
Signed	d in the presence of:		CITY OF NORTH ROYALTON
			ByLARRY ANTOSKIEWICZ, MAYOF
			And
			PORTS PETROLEUM
			ByPRESIDENT
			AndSECRETARY

Ordinance No. 24-15