



# City of North Royalton

Mayor Larry Antoskiewicz

**Nick Cinquepalmi**

*Service Director*

Service Department

440-582-3002

fax 440-582-3089

**TO:** Streets Committee – Joanne Krejci, Chair  
Linda Barath, Vice Chair  
Paul Marnecheck

**FROM:** Nick Cinquepalmi, Service Director

**DATE:** November 18, 2022

**RE:** 2023 Fuel Bid Recommendation

Please find attached bid tabulation from the Consortium bid opening on November 17, 2021 for the 2022-2023 Fuel Bid Program.

I am recommending the City of North Royalton exercise the second-year renewal option with Ports Petroleum for the contract term of 1/1/23-12/31/23 for Supplying Gasoline & Diesel Fuel.

If there are any questions, do not hesitate to contact me. Thanks.

/aca

Encl.

c: Mayor Larry Antoskiewicz  
Dana Schroeder, Legislative Director  
File

**CONSORTIUM BID TABULATION:  
SUPPLYING GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL**

Year 1 Contract Term: 1/1/22-12/31/22

Year 2 Contract Term: 1/1/23-12/31/23

Bid Opening: November 17, 2021 9:00 a.m.

Present: Becki Riser, City of Brecksville, Jessi Still, City of Brecksville, Gus Katsas, Petroleum Traders

Total Cost per Gallon Calculation: Sample OPIS average + Bid Differential + Sample Taxes & Fees	<b>PETROLEUM TRADERS</b> (same pricing Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)	<b>PORTS PETROLEUM</b> (different pricing Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)	<b>MANSFIELD OIL CO.</b> (different pricing Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)
	Price Differential (Add)	Total SampleCost/ Gallon	Price Differential (Add)	Total SampleCost/ Gallon	Price Differential (Add)	Total SampleCost/ Gallon
<b>NO LEAD REGULAR GRADE GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE, w/ 10% Ethanol Blend</b>						
Transport	(0.0298)	2.5892	Year 1: (0.0084) Year 2: (0.0089)	Year 1: 2.6106 Year 2: 2.6101	Year 1: .0146 Year 2: 0.0205	Year 1: 2.6336 Year 2: 2.6395
Tankwagon	NO BID	NO BID	Year 1: .0890 Year 2: .0890	Year 1: 2.7080 Year 2: 2.7980	NO BID	NO BID
Product Bid	Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.		Various		No lead regular grade gasoline, 87 Octane w/ 10% ethanol blend.	
Name & Location of Refiner	Marathon, Cleveland, OH		Various		Marathon Terminal - Brecksville, OH	
<b>ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 DIESEL</b>						
Transport	0.0097	2.7651	Year 1: (0.0074) Year 2: (0.0074)	Year 1: 2.7480 Year 2: 2.7480	Year 1: 0.0061 Year 2: 0.0124	Year 1: 2.7615 Year 2: 2.7678
Tankwagon	NO BID	NO BID	Year 1: .0890 Year 2: .0890	Year 1: 2.8444 Year 2: 2.8444	NO BID	NO BID
Product Bid	Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.		Various		Ultra Low Sulfur #2 Diesel	
Name & Location of Refiner	Marathon, Cleveland, OH		Various		Marathon Terminal - Brecksville, OH	
<b>TRANSPORT DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS</b>						
Gasoline	7500		8500		8500	
Diesel	7500		7500		7500	
<b>TANKWAGON DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS</b>						
Gasoline	NO BID		4,500 or less		NO BID	
Diesel	NO BID		4,500 or less		NO BID	
<b>EXCEPTIONS</b>	Due to ongoing shortage of drivers for common carriers, Petroleum Traders may request 48 hrs for delivery in event that no carriers are available to deliver within 24 hrs.		Diesel Cetane Min. 40 per ASTM D975.		None	
<b>REQUIRED DOCUMENTS SUBMITTED</b>	Yes		Yes		Yes	