



City of North Royalton Service Department
2023 Road Maintenance Program
Bidders Tabulation - EQUIPMENT & GENERAL PAVEMENT SERVICES

Bid Opening on Wednesday, February 22, 2023 at 10:00 am
 at North Royalton City Hall, 14600 State Rd

Description	Set In Stone Contracting, LLC				Crossroads Asphalt Recycling Inc				Geauga Highway Co				
	No Bid	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	No Bid	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	No Bid	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	
3/4 Ton or Larger Pickup Truck - Driver included	No Bid	Per Hour		Availability	\$85.00	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	No Bid	Per Hour		Availability	
Tandem Axle - Driver included for excavation & material handling	\$92.00	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	\$95.00	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	No Bid	Per Hour		Availability	
Tri-Axle - Driver included for excavation & material handling	\$105.00	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	\$105.00	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	No Bid	Per Hour		Availability	
Quad-Axle - Driver included for excavation & material handling	No Bid	Per Hour		Availability	\$120.00	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	No Bid	Per Hour		Availability	
Carry-All - Driver included for excavation & material handling	No Bid	Per Hour		Availability	\$215.00	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	No Bid	Per Hour		Availability	
Tack Coat Distributor – with Operator	No Bid	Per Hour		Availability	\$135.00	Per Hour	48 hrs	Availability	\$180.00	Per Hour		Availability	
Pneumatic Compactor – with Operator (#1 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$105.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	TruPac	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$4,000.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Rosco	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Milling Machine – with Operator (#2 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$315.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	W 60	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$12,500.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Wirtgen	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Milling Machine – with Operator (#2a on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$375.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	PM 312	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$15,000.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	CAT	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Milling Machine Full Depth Planing – with Operator (#3 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$675.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	200i	Model	\$700.00	Per Hour	10 hrs
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$27,000.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Wirtgen	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Hydraulic Track Excavator Medium – with Operator (#4 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$145.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	160 LC	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$5,800.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Hyundai	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Hydraulic Track Excavator Large – with Operator (#5 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$175.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	325	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$7,000.00	Per Week	1 week	Availability	CAT	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Track Type Dozer Small – with Operator (#6 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$145.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	550	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$5,800.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	John Deere	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Track Type Dozer Large – with Operator (#7 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$165.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	D-65	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$6,600.00	Per Week	1 week	Availability	Komatsu	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Compaction Roller 20 Ton Capacity – with Operator (#8 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$130.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	HD 110	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$5,200.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Hamm	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Road Widener – with Operator (#9 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$205.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	W 330	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$8,200.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Wieler	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Mechanical Street Sweeper – with Operator (#10 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$155.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	M6 Avalanche	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$6,200.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Schwarze	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Motor Grader – with Operator (#11 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$155.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	720	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$6,200.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Volvo	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Backhoe Loader – with Operator (#12 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$135.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	LB 95	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$5,400.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	New Holland	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Wheel Loader – with Operator (#13 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$135.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	624	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$5,400.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	John Deere	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Self-Propelled Asphalt Paver 5 to 9 feet – with Operator (#14 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$205.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	8550	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$8,200.00	Per Week	1 week	Availability	LeeBoy	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Self-Propelled Asphalt Paver 8 to 15 feet – with Operator (#15 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$265.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	5103	Model	\$400.00	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$10,600.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Vogele	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Self-Propelled Asphalt Paver 10 to 20 feet – with Operator (#16 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$375.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	1110	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$15,000.00	Per Week	1 week	Availability	Champion	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Tractor with Broom Attachment – with Operator (#17 on Spec List)	No Bid	Per Hour		Min to Mobilize	\$125.00	Per Hour	8 hrs	Min to Mobilize	DT 80	Model	No Bid	Per Hour	Min to Mobilize
	No Bid	Per Week		Availability	\$5,000.00	Per Week	48 hrs	Availability	Superior	Make	No Bid	Per Week	Availability
Additional Operators	No Bid	Per Hour			\$96.00	Per Hour					No Bid	Per Hour	
Additional Laborers	No Bid	Per Hour			\$86.00	Per Hour					No Bid	Per Hour	
(\$1,000 Bid Bond)													
Bid Bond	X				X				X				



City of North Royalton Service Department
2023 Road Maintenance Program
Bidders Tabulation - EQUIPMENT & GENERAL PAVEMENT SERVICES CONTINUED

Bid Opening on Wednesday, February 22, 2023 at 10:00 am
 at North Royalton City Hall, 14600 State Rd

Description	Unit	Set In Stone Contracting, LLC		Crossroads Asphalt Recycling Inc		Geauga Highway Co	
		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price	
Crafco Polyfiber Sealant							
ODOT I	LB	No Bid		\$1.50		No Bid	
ODOT II	LB	No Bid		\$1.60		No Bid	
ODOT IV	LB	No Bid		\$1.70		No Bid	
Partial Depth Joint Repair							
Grind Longitudinal Joint by the Lineal Foot	12"	LF	No Bid	\$4.50			\$9.00
	24"	LF	No Bid	\$5.50			\$15.00
Grind Transverse Joint or Crack by the Lineal Foot	12"	LF	No Bid	\$4.50		No Bid	
	24"	LF	No Bid	\$5.50		No Bid	
Fill with 448 Type I Asphaltic Concrete by the Cubic Yard	CU YD	No Bid		\$505.00			\$400.00
ODOT Approved Type I, II, or IV Cracksealer	LB	No Bid		\$1.80		No Bid	
Full Depth Recycling							
Full Depth Recycling	SQ YD	No Bid		\$5.50		No Bid	
CMS-2B by the Gallon	GAL	No Bid		\$4.25		No Bid	
Sub-Base Removal & Replacement	CU YD	No Bid		\$40.00		No Bid	
Alternate: ODOT #304 Limestone Added & Blended	CU YD	No Bid		\$49.00		No Bid	
Cement or Lime Stabilization							
Testing, Recycling & Blending of Material by the Square Yard	SQ YD	No Bid		\$7.00		No Bid	
Portland Cement	TON	No Bid		\$205.00		No Bid	
Quicklime	TON	No Bid		\$245.00		No Bid	
Hydrated Lime	TON	No Bid		\$255.00		No Bid	
Full Depth Asphalt Repair							
Asphalt Repairs	SQ FT	No Bid		\$40.00			\$8.00
Berm Rehabilitation							
Shoulder Preparation	SQ YD	No Bid		\$4.00		No Bid	
Installation of Shoulder Material	CU YD	No Bid		\$50.00		No Bid	
Prime Coat MC 30	GAL	No Bid		\$4.50		No Bid	
CRS-2 Asphalt Emulsion	GAL	No Bid		\$4.25			\$3.00
#8 Limestone	CU YD	No Bid		\$69.00			\$100.00
ODOT #409							
Single Surface Treatment	SQ YD	No Bid		\$2.25			\$2.45
Double Surface Treatment	SQ YD	No Bid		\$4.05			\$4.50
Asphaltic Concrete Placement							
ODOT #301 (material only)	CU YD	No Bid		\$138.00		No Bid	
ODOT #448 Type 2 (material only)	CU YD	No Bid		\$145.00		No Bid	
ODOT #448 Type 1 (material only)	CU YD	No Bid		\$169.00		No Bid	
Paver, material, trucking, compaction and labor shall be billed at their per unit hourly rates.							
Tack Material							
ODOT Spec CSS-1	GAL	No Bid		\$3.80		No Bid	
Non-Tracking Tack	GAL	No Bid		\$4.00		No Bid	
(\$1,000 Bid Bond)							
Bid Bond			X		X		X