

Turf Care Chemicals			
Crestbrook Park Golf Course			
Bid Summary March 23, 2023			
Vendor Name:			
Aspen Outdoors			
Allentown, PA	<i>Case/Container</i>	<i>Cost</i>	<i>Cost</i>
	<i>Size U/M</i>	<i>Per Gal/lb/Unit.</i>	<i>Per Case/Container</i>
FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO			
Talaris	2x2.5 case	\$58.00 gal	\$290.00
Propiconazole 14.3%			
Gunner	4x1 case	\$95.00 gal	\$380.00
Banol 1ec			
Propam	4x1 case	\$317.50	\$1,270.00
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum			
	no bid		
Chipco 26019 Flowable			
Irodine	2x2.5 case	\$70 gal	\$350.00
Chlorothalonil 54%			
Echo 720	2x2.5 case	\$32.00 gal	\$160.00
Fore 80wsp			
Manzate Pro	8x616 case	\$43.33 lb	\$260.00
Headway			
Artavia xcel	4x1 case	\$212.50 gal	\$850.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%	no bid		
Mefenoxam 22.5%			
Stergo mix	4x1 case	\$425.00 gal	\$1,700.00
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	4x1 case	\$101.25	\$305.00
Velista	no bid		
26 GT	no bid		
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 case	\$122.00 gal	\$610.00
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	4x1 case	\$218.75 gal	\$875.00
Trimec Bentgrass	no bid		
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%			
upend hydrocap	2x2.5 case	\$44.00 gal.	\$220.00
Round-up Pro			

Ghistar	2x2.5 case	\$25.00 gal	\$125.00	
Bensumec	no bid			
INSECTICIDES				
Arena 50 WDG	no bid			
Conserve	no bid			
Allectus GCSC	no bid			
Dylox 6.2G	no bid			
Imidacloprid 75%	88x1.6 oz		\$515.00	
Provaunt	no bid			
Bifenthrin 7.9%				
upstar rup	4x1 case	\$40.00 gal	\$160.00	
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	no bid			
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	no bid			
Matchpoint	no bid			
Ference	no bid			
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:				
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%				
Groom	2x2.5 case	\$122.00 gal	\$610.00	

Vendor Name:				
MetroTurf Specialists				
Brookfield, CT	<i>Case/Container</i>	<i>Cost</i>	<i>Cost</i>	
	<i>Size U/M</i>	<i>Per Gal/lb/Unit.</i>	<i>Per Case/Container</i>	
FUNGICIDES				
3336 FLO	2x2.5 gal	\$65.40 gal	\$327.00	
Propiconazole 14.3%	2x2.5 gal	\$83.00 gal	\$415.00	
Banol 1ec	2x2.5 gal	\$491.50 gal	\$2,457.50	
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	no bid			
Chipco 26019 Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$66.60 gal	\$333.00	
Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal	\$35.20 gal	\$176.00	
Fore 80wsp	8x4x1.5 lb	\$10.67 lb	\$512.16	
Headway	2x1 gal	\$303.00 gal	\$607.00	
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%	no bid			
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x2.5 gal	\$398.00 gal	\$1,990.00	
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	4x1 gal	\$94.25 gal	\$377.00	
Velista	22 oz	\$286.00	\$286.00	
26 GT	2x2.5 gal	\$242.20 gal	\$1,211.00	
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$122.00 gal	\$610.00	
HERBICIDES				
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$240.35 gal	\$1,201.75	
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$59.40 gal	\$297.00	
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	15 gal	\$65.54 gal	\$327.70	
Round-up Pro	2x2.5 gal	\$39.40 gal	\$197.00	
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$186.60 gal	\$933.00	
INSECTICIDES				
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$17.2125 oz	\$2,754.00	

Conserve	1 qt	\$139.00 qt	\$139.00	
Allectus GCSC	no bid			
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb	\$2.03 lb	\$60.90	
Imidacloprid 75%	88x6oz	\$701.00	\$701.00	
Provaunt	72 oz	\$6.00 oz	\$432.00	
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$48.25 gal	\$193.00	
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	240 ml	\$51.00	\$51.00	
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	4x5gal	\$1,137.50	\$4,550.00	
Matchpoint	4x64 oz	\$13.866 oz	\$3,411.20	
Ference	2x96 oz	\$20.00 oz	\$3,840.00	
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:				
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x2 5gal	\$139.00 gal	\$695.00	

Vendor Name:				
VG Acquisitions				
Holyoke, MA	<i>Case/Container</i>	<i>Cost</i>	<i>Cost</i>	
	<i>Size U/M</i>	<i>Per Gal/lb/Unit.</i>	<i>Per Case/Container</i>	
FUNGICIDES				
3336 FLO				
Armor Tech TM 462 F	2x2.5 gal	\$158.50 2.5 gal	\$317.00	
Propiconazole 14.3%	2x2.5 gal	\$235.00 2.5 gal	\$470.00	
Banol 1ec	2x2.5 gal	\$1,228.75 2.5 gal	\$2,457.50	
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	no bid			
Chipco 26019 Flowable				
Armor Tech IP 238	2x2.5 gal	\$232.50 2.5 gal	\$465.00	
Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal	\$101.00 2.5 gal	\$202.00	
Fore 80wsp	8x6 lb	\$73.75 6 lb	\$590.00	
Headway				
Armor Tech Azoxy T	4x1 gal	\$262.00 gal	\$1,048.00	
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%	2x2.5 gal	\$3612.55 2.5 gal	\$7,225.10	
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x1 gal	\$450.00 gal	\$900.00	
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%				
Armor Tech Teb 360 XL	4x1 gal	\$75.25 gal	\$301.00	
Velista	6x22 oz	\$286.00 22 oz	\$1,716.00	
26 GT				
Armor Tech IP 238	2x2.5 gal	\$232.50 2.5 gal	\$465.00	
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$305.00 2.5 gal	\$610.00	
HERBICIDES				
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$600.88 2.5 gal	\$1,201.76	
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$158.00 2.5 gal	\$316.00	
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	2x2.5 gal	\$158.00 2.5 gal	\$316.00	
Round-up Pro	2x2.5 gal	\$130.00 2.5 gal	\$260.00	
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$481.00 2.5 gal	\$962.00	
INSECTICIDES				
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$688.50 40 oz	\$2,754.00	

Conserve	4x1 qt	\$186.00 qt	\$744.00	
Allectus GCSC	no bid			
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb	\$68.00	\$68.00	
Imidacloprid 75%	no bid			
Provaunt	no bid			
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x 1 gal	\$50.50 gal	\$202.00	
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	6x240 ml	\$59.75 240 ml	\$358.50	
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	no bid			
Matchpoint	4x64 oz	\$852.80 64 oz	\$3,411.20	
Ference	no bid			
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:				
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x2.5 gal	\$295.00 2.5 gal	\$590.00	

Vendor Name:			
Charles C Hart Seed Co.			
Wethersfield, CT	<i>Case/Container</i>	<i>Cost</i>	<i>Cost</i>
	<i>Size U/M</i>	<i>Per Gal/lb/Unit.</i>	<i>Per Case/Container</i>
FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO	2x2.5 gal	\$148.90 gal	\$744.50
Propiconazole 14.3%			
Dorado	2x2.0 gal	\$89.35 gal	\$357.40
Banol 1ec	2.5 gal	\$755.60 gal	\$1889.00 (Agency)
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	no bid		
	discontinued		
Chipco 26019 Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$72.00 gal	\$360.00
Chlorothalonil 54%	2.5 gal	\$84.00 gal	\$210.00
			(daconil weatherstik agency)
Fore 80wsp	32x1.5 lb	\$11.65 lb	\$559.20
Headway	1 gal	\$536.00 gal	\$536.00 (Agency)
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%	No bid		
Mefenoxam 22.5%	1 gal	\$611.00 gal	\$611.00 (Agency)
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	5x1 gal	\$183.95 gal	\$919.75
Velista	22 oz	\$286.00 22 oz	\$286.00 (Agency)
26 GT	2x2.5 gal	\$211.75 gal	\$1,058.75
Enclave Flowable	no bid		
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2X2.5GAL	\$240.35 gal	\$1,201.75
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$42.50 gal	\$212.50
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	no bid		
Round-up Pro	no bid		
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$192.60 gal	\$963.00
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$275.40 lb	\$2,754.00

Conserve	4x1 qt,	\$663.55 gal	\$663.55	
Allectus GCSC	No bid			
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb bag	\$1.92 lb	\$57.60	
Imidacloprid 75%				
Merit 75WSP	16x1.6 oz	\$90.00 lb	\$144.00	
Provaunt	72 oz	\$432.00 72 oz	\$432.00 (Agency)	
Bifenthrin 7.9%				
Talstar Select	4x1 gal	\$78.65 gal	\$314.60	
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	No bid			
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	0.5 gal	\$1,137.50 5 gal	\$1,137.50 (Agency)	
Matchpoint	64 oz	\$213.20 lb	\$852.80	
Ference	96 oz	\$1,920.00 96 oz	\$1,920.00 (Agency)	
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:				
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x1 gal	\$178.67 gal	\$357.34	

Vendor Name:			
Siteone Landscape Supply			
Cleveland, OH	<i>Case/Container</i>	<i>Cost</i>	<i>Cost</i>
	<i>Size U/M</i>	<i>Per Gal/lb/Unit.</i>	<i>Per Case/Container</i>
FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO			
Lesco T-storm	2x2.5 gal	\$49.60 gal	\$248.00
Propiconazole 14.3%			
Quali-Pro PPZ 14.3	2x2.5 gal	\$67.60 gal	\$338.00
Banol 1ec	2x2.5 gal	\$491.50	\$2,457.00
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	No bid		
Chipco 26019 Flowable			
Lesco 18 Plus	2x2.5 gal	\$67.60 gal	\$338.00
Chlorothalonil 54%			
Lesco Manicure 6 FL	2x2.5 gal	\$39.60 gal	\$198.00
Fore 80wsp	4x1.5 lb	\$11.50 lb	\$69.00
Headway	4x 1 gal	\$536.00 gal	\$2,144.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%			
Insignia SC	2x2.5 gal	\$1,445.02	\$7,225.10
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x2.5 gal	\$507.60 gal	\$2,538.00
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%			
Tebuconazole 3.6%	4x1 gal	\$69.00 gal	\$276.00
Velista	6x22 oz	\$13.00 oz	\$1,716.00
26 GT			
Lesco 18 plus	2x2.5 gal	\$67.60 gal	\$338.00
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$122.00 gal	\$610.00
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$600.88 per 2.5 gal	\$1,201.76
Trimec Bentgrass			
Lesco Eliminate LO	2x2.5 gal	\$59.60 gal	\$298.00
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	2x2.5 gal	\$67.60 gal	\$338.00
Round-up Pro			
Prosecutor Pro	2x2.5 gal	47.60 gal	\$238.00
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$174.00 gal	\$870.00
INSECTICIDES			

Arena 50 WDG	20x40 oz	\$688.50 per 40 oz	\$13,770.00	
Conserve	12x1 qt	\$139.00 qt	\$1,668.00	
Allectus GCSC	No bid			
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb bag	\$2.03 lb	\$61.00	
Imidacloprid 75%				
Lesco Bandit 2F	4x1 gal	\$99.00 gal	\$396.00	
Provaunt	72 oz	\$6.00 oz	\$432.00	
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$49.00	\$196.00	
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	6x240 mil	\$61.00 per 240 mil	\$366.00	
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	2x64 oz	\$1137.50 per 64 oz	\$2,275.00	
Matchpoint	2x64 oz	\$1920.00 per 64 oz	\$1,705.60	
Ference	2x96 oz	\$1920.00 per 96 oz	\$3,840.00	
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:				
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%				
T-Nex	2x2.5 gal	\$115.60 gal	\$578.00	

Vendor Name:				
Heritage Profession Products				
Dallas, TX	<i>Case/Container</i>	<i>Cost</i>	<i>Cost</i>	
	<i>Size U/M</i>	<i>Per Gal/lb/Unit.</i>	<i>Per Case/Container</i>	
FUNGICIDES				
3336 FLO	2x2.5 gal	\$76.00 gal	\$380.00	
Propiconazole 14.3%	2x2.5 gal	\$67.00 gal	\$335.00	
Banol 1ec	2x2.5 gal	\$491.50	\$2,457.50	
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	No bid			
Chipco 26019 Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$86.75 gal	\$433.75	
Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal	\$35.00 gal	\$175.00	
Fore 80wsp	3 lb	\$10.10 lb	\$30.30	
Headway				
Posterity XT	2x2.5 gal	\$256 gal	\$1,280.00	
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%	4x30.5 oz	\$542.29 30.5 oz	\$2,169.16	
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x2.5 gal	\$435.00 gal	\$2,175.00	
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	4x1 gal	\$75.00 gal	\$300.00	
Velista	6x77 oz	\$286.00 22 oz	\$1,716.00	
26 GT	2x2.5 gal	\$220 gal	\$1,100.00	
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$122.00 gal	\$610.00	
HERBICIDES				
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$240.35	\$1,201.75	
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$61.02	\$305.10	
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	2x2.5 gal	\$60.42	\$302.10	
Round-up Pro	2x2.5 gal	\$44.00	\$220.00	
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$180.00 gal	\$900.00	
INSECTICIDES				

Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$688.50 40 oz	\$2,754.00	
Conserve	No bid			
Allectus GCSC	No Bid			
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb	\$60 bag	\$60.00	
Imidacloprid 75%	4x1 gal	\$82.14	\$328.56	
Provaunt	4x77 oz	\$432.00	\$1,728.00	
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$50 gal	\$200.00	
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	No bid			
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	2x1/2 gal	\$1,137.50	\$4,550.00	
Matchpoint	4x64 oz	\$852.80 64 oz	\$3,411.20	
Ference	2x 96 oz	\$1,920.00	\$3,840.00	
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:				
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x2.5 gal	\$120 gal	\$600.00	