

Turf Care Chemicals
Crestbrook Park Golf Course
Bid Summary March 31, 2022

Vendor Name:

The Cardinals Inc.
 Unionville, CT

	<i>Case/Container Size U/M</i>	<i>Cost Per Gal/lb/Unit.</i>	<i>Cost Per Case/Container</i>
FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO	2x2.5 gal	\$53.00	\$265.00
Propiconazole 14.3%	4x1	\$68.60	\$274.40
	2x2.5 gal	\$66.60	\$333.00
Banol 1ec	2x1 gal	\$365.00	\$730.00
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	No Bid		
Chipco 26019 Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$69.95	\$349.75
Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal	\$44.00	\$220.00
Fore 80wsp	No Bid		
Headway AZ Prop	2x1 gal	\$475.00	\$950.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0% AZ Prop	4x1 gal	\$250.00	\$10,000.00
Mefenoxam 22.5%	4x1 gal	\$343.00	\$1,372.00
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	4x1 gal	\$70.75	\$283.00
Velista	No bid		
26 GT	No bid		
Enclave Flowable	No bid		
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$279.00	\$1,395.00
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$49.00	\$245.00
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	no bid		

Round-up Pro	2.5 gal	\$54.00	\$135.00
Bensumec	2.25 gal	\$152.00	\$760.00
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	no bid		
Conserve	no bid		
Allectus GCSC	no bid		
Dylox 6.2G	30#/BS	\$2.10	\$63.00
Imidacloprid 75%	4x4 x 1.6 oz	77.79/#	\$124.50
	88x1.6 oz	49.77/#	\$438.00
Provaunt	no bid		
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$47.00	\$188.00
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	no bid		
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	no bid		
Matchpoint	no bid		
Ference	no bid		
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:			
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x1 gal	\$137.00	\$274.00
	2x2.5 gal	\$126.00	\$630.00

Vendor Name:

The Chas C. Hart Seed Co.

Wethersfield, CT

Case/Container Size U/M	Cost Per Gal/lb/Unit.	Cost Per Case/Container
----------------------------	--------------------------	----------------------------

FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO	2x2.5 gal	\$106.25	\$531.25
Propiconazole 14.3%	no bid		
Banol 1ec	2x2.5 gal	\$1,020.00	\$2,040.00
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	no bid		
	discontinued		
Chipco 26019 Flowable	2.2.5 gal	\$162.50	\$325.00

Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal	\$182.50	\$365.00
Fore 80wsp	32x1.5 lbs	\$9.63	\$462.00
Headway	2x1 gal	\$496.00	\$992.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%	no bid		
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x1 gal	\$571.00	\$1,142.00
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	5x1 gal	\$159.10	\$795.95
Velista	6x22 oz	\$242.00	\$1,452.00
26 GT	2x2.5 gal	\$484.37	\$968.74
Enclave Flowable	no bid		
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$538.75	\$1,077.50
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$120.80	\$241.60
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	no bid		
Round-up Pro	no bid		
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$381.15	\$762.30
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$615.75	\$2,463.00
Conserve	4x 1qt	\$150.93	\$603.72
Allectus GCSC	no bid		
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb bag	1.56 per lb	\$46.80
Imidacloprid 75%	no bid		
Provaunt	4x 72 oz	\$403.20	\$1,612.80
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$60.93	\$243.72

Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	no bid		
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	4x0.5 gal	\$1,115.50	\$4,462.00
Matchpoint	4x64 oz	\$827.80	\$3,311.20
Ference	2x96 oz	\$1,824.00	\$3,648.00
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:			
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x 1 gal	\$185.37	\$370.74

Vendor Name:

V. G. Acquisitions LLC
Holyoke, MA

<i>Case/Container Size U/M</i>	<i>Cost Per Gal/lb/Unit.</i>	<i>Cost Per Case/Container</i>
------------------------------------	----------------------------------	------------------------------------

FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO			
Armortech TM462	2x2.5 gal	\$160.00	\$320.00
Propiconazole 14.3%	2x25 gal	\$88.90	\$444.50
Banol 1ec			
Sipcam Karma	2x1 gal	\$313.50	\$627.00
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	no bid		
Chipco 26019 Flowable			
Armortech IP 238	2x2.5 gal	\$188.50	\$377.00
Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal	\$39.80	\$199.00
Fore 80wsp	8x6 lbs	\$10.42	\$500.00
Headway	2x1 gal	\$496.00	\$992.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%			
Insignia Intrinsic SC	2x2.5 gal	\$3,340.00	\$6,680.00
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x1 gal	\$451.00	\$902.00
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	4x1 gal	\$88.00	\$352.00
Velista	6x22 oz	\$11.00	\$1,452.00
26 GT			
Armortech IP 238	2x2.5 gal	\$188.50	\$377.00
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$122.00	\$610.00
HERBICIDES			

Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$215.50	\$1,077.50
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$50.80	\$254.00
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	2x2.5 gal	\$81.70	\$408.50
Round-up Pro	2.2.5 gal	\$55.80	\$279.00
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$158.80	\$794.00
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$14.98	\$2,396.00
Conserve	4x 1 qt	\$158.00	\$632.00
Allectus GCSC	no bid		
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb bag	\$1.77	\$53.00
Imidacloprid 75%	4x1 gal	\$65.50	\$262.00
Provaunt	72 oz	\$5.60	\$403.20
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$51.00	\$204.00
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	6x240 ml	\$59.75	\$358.50
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	4x 64 oz	\$1,115.50	\$4,462.00
Matchpoint	4x64 oz	\$827.80	\$3,311.20
Ference	2x96 oz	\$1,824.00	\$3,648.00
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:			
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x1 gal	\$148.00	\$296.00

Vendor Name:

Metro Turf Specialists

Brookfield, CT

Case/Container
Size U/M

Cost
Per Gal/lb/Unit.

Cost
Per Case/Container

FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO	2x2.5 gal		\$687.00
Propiconazole 14.3%	2x2.5 gal		\$498.00
Banol 1ec	2x2.5 gal		\$2,040.00

Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	no bid		
Chipco 26019 Flowable	2x2.5 gal		\$339.00
Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal		\$208.00
Fore 80wsp	8x4x1.5 lb		\$555.00
Headway	1 gal		\$496.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0% Insignia SC	2x2.5 gal		\$6,680.00
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x2.5 gal		\$2,222.00
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	1 gal		\$166.00
	4x1 gal		\$419.00
Velista	22 oz		\$242.00
26 GT	2x2.5 gal		\$133.00
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal		\$610.00
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal		\$1,077.50
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal		\$307.00
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	no bid		
Round-up Pro	2x2.5 gal		\$348.00
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal		\$811.00
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz		\$2,562.00
Conserve	1 qt.		\$149.00
Allectus GCSC	no bid		
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb		\$48.00
Imidacloprid 75%	88x1.6 oz		\$766.00

Provaunt	72 oz		\$403.20
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal		\$212.00
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	240 ml		\$61.00
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	4x0.5 gal		\$4,462.00
Matchpoint	4x64 oz		\$3,311.20
Ference	96 oz		\$1,824.00
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:			
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x2.5 gal		\$727.00