

Turf Care Chemicals
Crestbrook Park Golf Course
Bid Summary May 13, 2021

Vendor Name:

The Terre Company

Clifton, NJ

	<i>Case/Container Size U/M</i>	<i>Cost Per Gal/lb/Unit.</i>	<i>Cost Per Case/Container</i>
FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO	2x2.5 gal	\$102.00	\$510.00
Propiconazole 14.3%	2x2.5 gal	\$110.00	\$550.00
Banol 1ec agency product	2x2.5 gal	\$199.00	\$9,900.00
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum agency product	2x2.5 gal	\$277.00	\$1,385.00
Chipco 26019 Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$62.50	\$312.00
Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal	\$64.00	\$320.00
Fore 80wsp	8x4x1.5 lbs	\$20.41	\$490.00
Headway agency product	2x1 gal	\$438.00	\$876.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%	no bid	no bid	no bid
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x1 gal	\$538.00	\$1,076.00
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	2x2.5 gal	\$70.00	\$350.00
Velista agency product	6x22 oz	\$10.00	\$220.00
26 GT	2x2.5 gal	\$182.00	\$911.40
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$104.00	\$520.00
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$215.50	\$1,077.50
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$54.00	\$270.00
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	no bid	no bid	no bid

Round-up Pro	2x1 gal	\$94.55	\$189.11
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$158.00	\$790.00
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$717.00	\$2,869.00
Conserve	4x1 qt	\$155.00	\$625.00
Allectus GCSC	4x64 oz	\$321.00	\$1,284.00
Dylox 6.2G	2x2.5 gal	\$198.84	\$397.68
Imidacloprid 75%	30 lbs	\$1.84	\$55.00
Provaunt agency product	4x72 oz	\$5.30	\$1,057.00
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$64.00	\$256.00
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	6x240 ml	\$60.78	\$364.68
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	4x.05 gal	\$515.75	\$2,063.00
Matchpoint	64 oz	\$990.00	\$990.00
Ference	2x96 oz	\$1,756.80	\$3,513.60
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:			
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x1 gal	\$132.50	\$265.00

Vendor Name:

Valley Green Inc.
Plainville, CT

	Case/Container Size U/M	Cost Per Gal/lb/Unit.	Cost Per Case/Container
FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO nufarm TM 4.5 f	2x2.5 gal	\$137.50	\$275.00
Propiconazole 14.3%	2x2.5 gal	\$122.00	\$244.00
Banol 1ec Sipcam Pro Plant	2x1 gal	\$286.50	\$573.00
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	no bid	no bid	no bid
Chipco 26019 Flowable Quali-Pro Ipro 2SE	2x2.5 gal	\$160.50	\$321.00

Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal	\$88.50	\$177.00
Fore 80wsp	8x6 lbs	\$56.50	\$452.00
Headway	2x1 gal	\$438.00	\$876.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%			
Insignia Intrinsic SC	2x2.5 gal	\$2,957.50	\$5,915.00
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x1 gal	\$440.00	\$880.00
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%			
Rotam Offset	4x1 gal	\$63.50	\$254.00
Velista	6x22 oz	\$220.00	\$1,320.00
26 GT			
Quali-Pro Ipro 2SE	2x2.5 gal	\$160.50	\$321.00
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$265.00	\$530.00
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$538.75	\$1,077.50
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$110.25	\$220.50
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	2x2.5 gal	\$170.75	\$341.50
Round-up Pro			
Ranger Pro	2x2.5 gal	\$38.00	\$76.00
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$349.75	\$699.50
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$597.75	\$2,391.00
Conserve	4x 1qt	\$147.25	\$589.00
Allectus GCSC	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb bag	\$46.25	\$46.25
Imidacloprid 75%			
Quali-Pro Imidacloprid 75WSP	88x1.6 oz packets	\$5.50	\$484.00
Provaunt	72 oz	\$381.60	\$381.60
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$42.75	\$171.00
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	6x240 ml	\$45.25	\$271.50

Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	4x64 oz	\$1,031.50	\$4,126.00
Matchpoint	4x64 oz	\$792.00	\$3,168.00
Ference	2x96 oz	\$1,756.80	\$3,513.60
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:			
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%			
Quali-Pro T-Nex 1 AQ	2x2.5 gal	\$341.25	\$654.70

Vendor Name:

Metro Turf Specialists

Brookfield, CT

	Case/Container Size U/M	Cost Per Gal/lb/Unit.	Cost Per Case/Container
FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO			
Quali-Pro TM 4.5 FLO	2x2.5 gal	\$53.20	\$266.00
Propiconazole 14.3%			
Nuform	2x2.5 gal	\$58.60	\$293.00
Banol 1ec	2x2.5 gal	\$399.68	\$1,998.40
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	no bid	no bid	no bid
Chipco 26019 Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$59.40	\$297.00
Chlorothalonil 54%	2x2.5 gal	\$42.40	\$212.00
Fore 80wsp	8x4x1.5	\$9.94	\$477.12
Headway			
Quali-Pro	2x1 gal	\$294.00	\$588.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%			
BASF	2x2.5 gal	\$1,220.00	\$6,100.00
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x2.5 gal	\$386.60	\$1,933.00
Torque/Tubuconazol 38.7%	4x1 gal	\$75.77	\$303.08
Velista	22 oz	\$220.00	\$220.00
26 GT	no bid	see 26019	no bid
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$106.00	\$530.00
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$215.50	\$1,077.50

Trimec Bentgrass	no bid	no bid	no bid
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	no bid	no bid	no bid
Round-up Pro Quali-Pro Plus	2x2.5 gal	\$27.80	\$139.00
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$142.60	\$713.00
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$597.75	\$2,391.00
Conserve	4x 1 qt	\$134.00	\$536.00
Allectus GCSC	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb	\$1.60	\$48.00
Imidacloprid 75%	4x4x1.6 oz	\$87.00	\$87.00
Provaunt	72 oz	\$5.30	\$381.60
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$48.25	\$193.00
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	240 ml	\$47.00	\$47.00
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	4x 1/2 gal	\$1,031.50	\$4,126.00
Matchpoint	4x4 lb	\$198.00	\$3,168.00
Ference	2x96 oz	\$18.30	\$3,513.60
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:			
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%	2x2.5 gal	\$122.40	\$612.00

Vendor Name:

The Chas C. Hart Seed Co.

Wethersfield, CT

Case/Container Size U/M	Cost Per Gal/lb/Unit.	Cost Per Case/Container
----------------------------	--------------------------	----------------------------

FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO	2x2.5 gal	\$110.00	\$550.00
Propiconazole 14.3% Dorado	2x2.0 gal	\$74.50	\$298.00
Banol 1ec	2x2.5 gal	\$399.68	\$1,998.40

Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	no bid	no bid	no bid
Chipco 26019 Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$59.38	\$296.90
Chlorothalonil 54%			
Daconil Weatherstik	2x2.5 gal	\$64.00	\$320.00
Fore 80wsp			
Fore 80WP Rainshield	32x1.5 lb	\$9.75	\$468.00
Headway	2x1 gal	\$438.00	\$876.00
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%	no bid	no bid	no bid
Mefenoxam 22.5%	no bid	no bid	no bid
Torque/Tubuconazol 38.7%	5x1 gal	\$156.60	\$783.00
Velista	6x22 oz	\$220.00	\$1,320.00
26 GT	2x2.5 gal	\$193.75	\$968.75
Enclave Flowable	no bid	no bid	no bid
HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$215.50	\$1,077.50
Trimec Bentgrass	no bid	no bid	no bid
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60%	no bid	no bid	no bid
Round-up Pro	2x2.5 gal	\$29.84	\$149.20
Bensumec	2x2.5 gal	\$152.46	\$762.30
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	4x40 oz	\$597.75	\$2,391.00
Conserve	4x1 qt.	\$644.00	\$2,576.00
Allectus GCSC	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb	\$1.72	\$51.60
Imidacloprid 75%			
Zenith 75WSP	16x1.6 oz	\$50.00 lb	\$80.00
Provaunt			

WDG (Agency)	72 oz	\$84.80 lb	\$381.60
Bifenthrin 7.9%			
Talstar S Golf	4x1 gal	\$61.66	\$246.64
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	no bid	no bid	no bid
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid)	4x0.5 gal	\$2,063.00	\$4,126.00
Matchpoint	64 oz	\$198/lb	\$792.00
Ference	2x96 oz	\$1,756.80	\$3,513.60
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:			
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%			
Podium	2x1 gal	\$146.25	\$292.50

Vendor Name:

SiteOne Landscape Supply
Cleveland, Ohio

	Case/Container Size U/M	Cost Per Gal/lb/Unit.	Cost Per Case/Container
FUNGICIDES			
3336 FLO			
Lesco T-Storm	2x2.5 gal	\$39.20	\$196.00
Propiconazole 14.3%			
Lesco Spectator Ultra	2x2.5 gal	\$61.91	\$309.55
Banol 1ec	2x2.5 gal	\$399.68	\$1,998.40
Agency			
Bayleton 50 Mini Drum	2x2.5 gal	\$554.00	\$2,770.00
Agency			
Chipco 26019 Flowable			
Lesco 18 Plus	2x2.5 gal	\$55.72	\$278.60
Chlorothalonil 54%			
Manicure 6FL	2x2.5 gal	\$45.42	\$227.10
Fore 80wsp	2x4x1.5 lb	\$10.63	\$127.56
Headway	4x 1 gal	\$438.00	\$1,752.00
Agency			
Pyraclostrobin 20.0%			
Pageant (Agency)	4x 1lb	\$95.60	\$382.40
Mefenoxam 22.5%	2x2.5 gal	\$399.20	\$1,996.00
Torque/Tebuconazol 38.7%	4x1 gal	\$66.17	\$264.68
Velista	6x22 oz	\$10.00	\$1,320.00
Agency			
26 GT			
Chipco Signature 266T	2x2.5 gal	\$226.36	\$1,131.80
Enclave Flowable	2x2.5 gal	\$106.00	\$530.00

HERBICIDES			
Dimension 2EW	2x2.5 gal	\$215.50	\$1,077.50
Trimec Bentgrass	2x2.5 gal	\$52.58	\$262.90
Pendulum/Pendimethalin 60% Agency	15 gal	\$51.00	\$765.00
Round-up Pro			
Round-up Pro Max	2x2.5 gal	\$75.21	\$376.05
Bensumec 4 LF	2x2.5 gal	\$149.16	\$745.80
INSECTICIDES			
Arena 50 WDG	2x40 oz (2.5 lb)	\$239.10	\$1,195.50
Conserve	2x1 qt	\$149.00	\$298.00
Allectus GCSC	no bid	no bid	no bid
Dylox 6.2G	30 lb	\$1.67	\$50.01
Imidacloprid 75% Lesco Bandit 2F	4x1 gal	\$63.56	\$254.24
Provaunt Agency	4x72 oz	\$5.30	\$1,526.40
Bifenthrin 7.9%	4x1 gal	\$69.00	\$276.00
Tempo Ultra GC/Cyfluthrin 11.8%	no bid	no bid	no bid
Acelepryn (Turf Insecticide Liquid) Agency	4x64 oz	\$1,031.50	\$4,126.00
Matchpoint	64 oz	\$792.00	\$792.00
Ference	96 oz	\$18.30	\$1,756.80
GROWTH REGULATORS, WETTING AGENTS & BIO STIMULANTS:			
Trinexapac-ethyl 11.3%			
T-Nex	2x2.5 gal	\$128.21	\$641.05